

1 ADAM J. GUTRIDE (State Bar No. 181446)
adam@gutridesafier.com
2 SETH A. SAFIER (State Bar No. 197427)
seth@gutridesafier.com
3 KRISTEN G. SIMPLICIO (State Bar No. 263291)
kristen@gutridesafier.com
4 **GUTRIDE SAFIER LLP**
100 Pine Street, Suite 1250
5 San Francisco, California 94111
Telephone: 415.271.6469
6 Facsimile: 415.449.6469

7 HASSAN A. ZAVAREEI (State Bar No. 181547)
hzavareei@tzlegal.com
8 JEFFREY D. KALIEL (State Bar No. 238293)
jkaliel@tzlegal.com
9 ANDREW J. SILVER (*pro hac vice*)
asilver@tzlegal.com
10 **TYCKO & ZAVAREEI LLP**
1828 L Street, N.W., Suite 1000
11 Washington, DC 20036
Telephone: (202) 973-0900
12 Facsimile: (202) 973-0950

13 Attorneys for Plaintiff and the Class

14 UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
15 NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA
16 OAKLAND DIVISION

17 ROHINI KUMAR, individual, on behalf of
18 herself, the general public and those similarly
situated

19 Plaintiff,

20 v.

22 SALOV NORTH AMERICA CORPORATION,
23 Defendant.
24

CASE NO. 14-cv-2411 (YGR)

**DECLARATION OF ADAM J. GUTRIDE
MOTION FOR FINAL APPROVAL OF
CLASS ACTION SETTLEMENT AND
APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS'
FEES, COSTS AND INCENTIVE
AWARDS**

Date: May 30, 2017

Time: 2:00 p.m.

Courtroom 1, Fourth Floor

Judge: Hon. Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers

25
26
27
28

1 I, Adam Gutride, declare as follows:

2 1. I am a member of this Court and attorney of record for Plaintiff Rohini Kumar in
3 this action.

4 2. I am a partner in Gutride Safier LLP (“GSLLP” or “Firm”), which has been
5 appointed Class Counsel in the above-captioned matter. The information below is stated based on
6 personal knowledge. I am competent to testify to the facts set forth below, and if called as a
7 witness and placed under oath, I would testify to those facts.

8 3. I make this Declaration in support of Plaintiff’ motion for final approval and
9 attorneys’ fees and costs and incentive awards (“Motion”). In that regard, I discuss, in the
10 following order: (a) the history of this litigation, which includes a summary description of the legal
11 services provided by GSLLP in this litigation to date; (b) the risks borne by GSLLP; (c) the time,
12 rate, expenses, and other data underlying the Motion; and (d) GSLLP’s continuing obligations in
13 this litigation and under the Settlement Agreement.

14 **A. History of the Litigation.**

15 4. On March 21, 2014, Plaintiff filed a complaint against Defendant in the above-
16 captioned case, in which Plaintiff alleged that Defendant had deceptively marketed and sold its
17 Filippo Berio brand of olive oil with the representation “Imported from Italy” on the front label,
18 although the back label stated that most of the oil was extracted in countries other than Italy from
19 olives grown in those other countries. Plaintiff further alleged that, by marketing the Products as
20 “Imported from Italy,” Defendant caused people to purchase the Products who would not
21 otherwise have done so, and that the Products were sold at a higher retail price than they would
22 have been sold without the misstatements.

23 5. GSLLP drafted and filed the Complaint and caused it to be served. Prior to doing
24 so, GSLLP spent time communicating with Plaintiff Kumar concerning her claims, gathering her
25 documentation, and negotiating with her a retainer agreement. GSLLP also undertook extensive
26 pre-filing investigation, including without limitation, researching, tracking, and analyzing
27 Defendant’s marketing, advertising, and product packaging, and reviewing Defendant’s websites,
28 press releases, public filings, and online documents. GSLLP spent additional time analyzing Food

1 and Drug Administration (“FDA”) regulations and Customs and Border Patrol (“CBP”)
2 regulations, and the California Health and Safety Code. GSLLP also researched and analyzed
3 related state regulations. GSLLP also conducted research regarding potential federal preemption of
4 Plaintiff’s claims. Throughout this litigation, GSLLP has continued to monitor, research, and
5 review such materials.

6 6. GSLLP also negotiated a co-counsel arrangement with Tycko & Zavareei (“TZ”),
7 which had experience prosecuting similar olive oil litigation in the District of Columbia.
8 Throughout the litigation, GSLLP worked closely with TZ to formulate case strategy. Work was
9 divided between the firms to avoid duplication—for example, the TZ firm was assigned to be lead
10 on taking depositions of fact witnesses, while my firm was lead for dealing with the expert
11 witnesses. Document review was apportioned between the firms and only documents identified as
12 by a reviewer as “hot documents” were shared. Similarly, in connection with legal research and
13 brief writing, one firm was assigned to draft all (or certain sections) of a brief, while the other
14 provided only suggestions and edits.

15 7. After filing the Complaint, Defendant filed a motion to dismiss. GSLLP reviewed
16 Defendant’s arguments and researched to draft the opposition to that motion, which was filed in
17 August of 2014. I appeared and argued at the hearing on the motion to dismiss.

18 8. In November of 2015, Defendant filed a motion to stay the proceedings in this case
19 pending the resolution of purportedly related matters pending on appeal in the Ninth Circuit.
20 GSLLP reviewed Defendant’s arguments on that motion and participated in the drafting and filing
21 of Plaintiff’s opposition in December of 2015.

22 9. GSLLP drafted and filed numerous case management statements in this case,
23 including in August 2014, November 2014, January 2015, and February 2015. GSLLP
24 additionally participated in the filing of case management-related stipulations in September 2015,
25 October 2015, December 2015, February 2016, May 2016, July 2016, August 2016, September
26 2016, and November 2016. GSLLP also attended case management conferences in this case.

27 10. Throughout this case, GSLLP participated in the discovery efforts, including
28 drafting and serving requests on Defendant and third parties. GSLLP also met-and-conferred with

1 Defendant's counsel regarding the scope of discovery, the sufficiency of discovery responses and
2 production, the retention of electronic documents, Defendant's searches for electronically stored
3 information, the terms and scope of a stipulated protective order, and the timing of production.

4 11. GSLLP also took part in briefing discovery disputes in this matter regarding the
5 timing of discovery, Defendant's request to take foreign discovery from an Australian olive oil
6 testing laboratory, and Plaintiff's request to take foreign discovery from Defendant's Italian parent
7 company.

8 12. In total, over 30,000 pages of documents were produced in this case, and GSLLP
9 assisted in the document review efforts in this case.

10 13. GSLLP also took the deposition of Defendant's expert economics witness,
11 defended the deposition of Plaintiff, and defended the deposition of Plaintiff's expert economics
12 witness.

13 14. After obtaining significant discovery from Defendant in this case, GSLLP
14 participated in conducting research for, drafting, and filing Plaintiff's Motion for Class
15 Certification, which was filed in January of 2016. Upon receiving Defendant's opposition to that
16 motion, GSLLP participated in the research and drafting of Plaintiff's reply memorandum, which
17 was filed in May of 2016. I appeared and argued at the hearing on this motion on May 24, 2016.
18 After the class certification motion was submitted, the Court asked for further declarations
19 regarding Class Counsel's qualifications and on the pending motions to seal portions of the
20 briefing, on which GSLLP participated in the drafting and filing.

21 15. After the Court granted Plaintiff's Motion for Class Certification, the parties started
22 to discuss the possibilities of mediation and settlement in August 2016 (Dkt. 130). I drafted the
23 initial proposals, and then on November 8, 2016, GSLLP participated in the drafting of a
24 comprehensive mediation statement and attended an all-day mediation (10+ hours) with Randy
25 Wulff of Wulff Quinby & Sochynsky, an independent, well respected, and experienced mediator,
26 in Oakland, California. The parties made significant progress during the mediation, and following
27 it, GSLLP took the lead on negotiating and drafting the Settlement Agreement along with
28 corresponding documents, including claim forms, summary notice, and long form notice.

1 16. Because the parties were able to arrive at a nationwide settlement, GSLLP
2 participated in the drafting and filing of an Amended Complaint in this matter, asserted nationwide
3 claims consistent with the nationwide settlement class contemplated by the Settlement Agreement.

4 17. After the parties entered into the Settlement Agreement, GSLLP participated in the
5 drafting and filing of the motion for preliminary approval of the settlement and its supporting
6 documents. I appeared and argued at the hearing on this motion.

7 18. After filing the motion for preliminary approval of the settlement, GSLLP
8 supervised the work of the claims administrator in this matter. For example, I tested the operation
9 of the settlement website, and I and my colleagues at GSLLP have corresponded with the claims
10 administrator regarding the notice and claims process, including regarding inquiries from class
11 members. GSLLP will continue to participate in these efforts throughout and following the claims
12 process.

13 19. GSLLP also participated in the drafting and filing of the instant motion for final
14 approval of the settlement, and I will appear at the hearing on that motion. Among other things, I
15 worked with Plaintiff's economics expert regarding his declaration in support of final approval.

16 20. GSLLP's work in this case is delineated in even greater detail in the
17 contemporaneous time entries attached to this Declaration, as discussed in Section C.

18 21. Should any objections to the settlement be filed prior to the hearing on final
19 approval, GSLLP will research and respond to those objections by, if necessary, filing oppositions
20 to them and/or a reply memorandum in support of the motion for final approval of the settlement.

21 22. After engaging in all of the aforementioned tasks, as a partner with GSLLP, I am in
22 a unique position to evaluate this Settlement. Indeed, in advising the Representative Plaintiff
23 whether or not to enter into the Settlement Agreement, I was very cognizant of the risks involved
24 in protracted litigation. I was also cognizant of Defendant's size and financial resources.

25 23. When considering the risks and costs associated with proceeding to trial against the
26 nature of the benefit that was being offered by Defendant, it was clear that the Settlement is in the
27 best interests of the class. Indeed, with this Settlement, Plaintiff has achieved her desired goal in
28 this litigation—i.e., obtaining for class members cash refunds and changes to Defendant's labeling

1 practices. Based on my evaluation of the facts and legal issues presented, I believe that the
2 settlement is fair, adequate, and reasonable. Indeed, I believe this is an excellent settlement.

3 24. Plaintiff Kumar is requesting an incentive award of \$2,500. Plaintiff Kumar took on
4 the risk of the possibility of bearing Defendant's costs in a losing effort. She worked with counsel
5 to provide information and respond to discovery throughout the litigation. As many of
6 Defendant's arguments centered on the standing and typicality of Ms. Kumar, the amount of her
7 work in this case was greater than in the average consumer case. Kumar conducted lengthy
8 searches of her personal records. She also spent a good deal of time preparing for and being
9 deposed.

10 25. Plaintiff has been actively involved in the litigation prior to and after this
11 Settlement. In my opinion, Plaintiff's participation in this litigation has been exemplary.

12 **B. The Risks Borne By GSSLP.**

13 26. In accepting this case, GSSLP bore considerable risk. GSSLP took this case on a
14 fully contingent basis, meaning that we were not paid for any of our time, and that we paid all
15 costs and out of pocket expenses without any reimbursement to date. From the outset, GSSLP
16 recognized that it would be contributing a substantial amount of time and advancing significant
17 costs in prosecuting a nationwide class action, with no guarantee of compensation or recovery, in
18 the hopes of prevailing against a well-funded defense. During the course of the litigation, GSSLP
19 turned away other cases due to its involvement with this matter. Among these were cases that were
20 subsequently filed by other firms.

21 27. Because Defendant was represented by a large, highly-skilled and well-resourced
22 litigation firm, there was increased risk that Plaintiffs would receive a verdict for the Defense after
23 a prolonged trial.

24 **C. Lodestar and Expenses for GSSLP**

25 28. A true and correct copy of the firm resume of GSSLP was submitted as part of the
26 class certification briefing the Court reviewed in certifying a California class. (Dkt. 85-9.)

27 29. GSSLP has worked on two other matters related to olive oil marketing practices
28 that contain allegations similar to those in this case. GSSLP has maintained separate billing

1 records for this case under the case name “Salov” and for each of the two other cases. In addition,
 2 because certain tasks in the three matters have sometimes overlapped, GSSLP has maintained
 3 separate billing records under the case name “OliveOil” for general work performed related to all
 4 three matters. Attached hereto as Exhibit 1 is a true and correct copy of the contemporaneous
 5 billing records entered and maintained by GSSLP under the case name “Salov” for the work
 6 specific to this case. Attached hereto as Exhibit 2 is a true and correct copy of the
 7 contemporaneous billing records entered and maintained by GSSLP under the case name
 8 “OliveOil” for the work that more generally applies to all three olive oil cases. With respect to the
 9 “OliveOil” work (Exhibit 2), GSSLP is only seeking to recover for one-third of the hours, or 123
 10 hours of time.

11 30. Based on the time records of GSSLP as described in the preceding paragraph,
 12 GSSLP has spent approximately 1103.5 hours prosecuting this litigation through February 28,
 13 2017.¹ The total number of hours, as well as the lodestar computed at our 2017 rates, is as shown
 14 in the following table:

15 Attorney (Position)	Hours	Rate	Total
16 Adam J. Gutride	460.6	\$950	437,570
17 Seth A. Safier	258.4	\$925	\$239,020
18 Todd Kennedy	19	\$850	\$16,150
19 Kristen Simplicio	311.8	\$775	\$241,645
20 Marie McCrary	20.9	\$750	\$15,675
21 Matt McCrary	32.8	\$725	\$23,780
22 TOTAL	1103.5		\$973,840.00

23 31. The hourly rates shown for the attorneys at GSSLP are the same as the regular rates
 24 charged in 2017 for their services in other litigation.

25 32. I understand my co-counsel utilizes the Laffey Matrix, which provides market rates
 26 for attorneys working in the Washington, D.C., and Baltimore areas, and is discussed in Paragraph
 27 _____

28 ¹ Time for March 2017 has not yet been entered by some timekeepers, so March time is omitted from these totals. GSSLP will update its lodestar and costs in a reply declaration, as necessary.

1 26 of the declaration of Hassan Zavareii. Utilizing that matrix, GSLLP's lodestar computed using
2 the matrix's 2017 rates, is shown in the following table:

3	4	5	6	7
	Attorney (Position)	Hours	Rate	Total
5	Adam J. Gutride	460.6	\$826	380,455.60
6	Seth A. Safier	258.4	\$685	177,004.00
7	Todd Kennedy	19	\$685	13,105.00
8	Kristen Simplicio	311.8	\$608	189,574.40
9	Marie McCrary	20.9	\$608	12,707.20
10	Matt McCrary	32.8	\$608	19,942.40
11	TOTAL	1103.5		\$792,698.60

12
13 33. On February 24, 2016, Judge Peter Kirwan of the Santa Clara Superior Court
14 approved rates GSLLP's 2015 rates of \$825 for me, \$800 for Seth Safier, and \$700 for Todd
15 Kennedy, in *Mackinnon v. IMVU, Inc.* Case No. 111 CV 193767 (County of Santa Clara). On
16 February 20, 2015, Magistrate Judge Beeler, approved GSLLP's 2014 rates of \$725 per hour for
17 Seth Safier and \$750 for me, and \$700 for Jay Kuo, in *Miller v. Ghirardelli Chocolate Company*,
18 Case No. 12-cv-4936 (N.D. Cal.). On February 20, 2014, Judge Ernest Goldsmith of the San
19 Francisco Superior Court approved GSLLP's 2013 rates of \$700 per hour for me and \$675 for
20 Seth Safier in *Haven v. Betz & Sons, Inc., et al*, Case No. 438719. On December 11, 2013, Judge
21 Claudia Wilken approved GSLLP's 2013 rates of \$700 per hour for me, \$675 for Seth Safier, \$625
22 for Jay Kuo and \$450 for Kristen Simplicio, in *Rainbow Business Solutions, et al v. Merchant*
23 *Services, et al*, Case No. CV 10-01993 CW (N.D. Cal). On August 1, 2013, Judge Dale S. Fischer
24 approved GSLLP's 2013 rates of \$700 per hour for me, \$675 for Seth Safier, and \$450 for Kristen
25 Simplicio, in *Mancini, et al v Ticketmaster, et al*, Case No. 07-cv-01459-DSF-JTL (C.D. Cal). On
26 June 1, 2012, Judge Jeffrey White approved GSLLP's 2012 rates of \$650 per hour for me, \$625
27 for Seth Safier and \$400 for Kristen Simplicio, in *Chavez v. Blue Sky Beverage, et al*, Case No.
28 06-cv-6609 (N.D. Cal.). On February 14, 2012, Chief Judge James Ware approved GSLLP's 2011

1 rates of \$625 per hour for me, \$600 for Seth Safier, and \$375 for Kristen Simplicio, in *Embry v.*
2 *Acer America Corporation*, Case No. 5:09-cv-1808 (ND. Cal.). On November 30, 2011, Judge
3 James F. Holderman approved GSSLP's 2010 rates of \$600 per hour for me and \$575 per hour for
4 Seth Safier in *In Re: Kentucky Grilled Chicken Coupon Marketing & Sales Practices Litigation*,
5 Case No. 1:09-cv-07670 (ND. Ill.). On November 22, 2011, Judge John Munter approved
6 GSSLP's 2011 rates of \$625 per hour for me, \$600 per hour for Seth Safier, and \$375 per hour for
7 Kristen Simplicio in *Gauss v. Millennium Products, Inc.*, Case No. CGC-10-503347. On
8 December 24, 2009, GSSLP's 2009 rates of \$550 for me and \$525 for Seth Safier were approved
9 by Judge Richard A. Kramer in *Deaton et al v. Hotwire*, Case Number CGC-05- 437631. On
10 August 20, 2008, rates of \$525 for me \$500 for Seth Safier were approved by Judge Charlotte
11 Walter Woolard in *Nelsen v. PeoplePC*, Case Number 07-460240. On April 30, 2008, rates of
12 \$475 for me and \$450 for Seth Safier were approved by Judge Charlotte Walter Woolard in
13 *Howard et al. v. Betz & Sons*, Case Number CGC-03-422529. On April 14, 2008, rates of \$450 for
14 me and \$425 for Seth Safier were approved by Judge Mary E. Wiss in *Cho v. Seagate*, Case
15 Number CGC-06-453195. On February 5, 2008, rates of \$475 for me and \$450 for Seth Safier
16 were approved in by Judge William Alsup in *Siemers v. Wells Fargo*, Case No. 3:05-cv-04518-
17 WHA (N.D. Cal.). On November 20, 2006, rates of \$450 for me and \$425 for Seth Safier were
18 approved by Judge Richard A Kramer in *Vroegh v. Dane Electric et al.*, Case No. CGC-04-
19 428953.

20 34. I am a 1994 graduate from Yale Law School. Seth Safier is a 1998 graduate from
21 Harvard Law School. Ms. Simplicio is 2007 graduate of the American University, Washington
22 College of Law. Ms. McCrary is a 2008 graduate of New York University Law School.

23 35. Mr. Gutride and Mr. Safier were previously attorneys at the law firm of Orrick
24 Herrington & Sutcliffe. It is my understanding that attorneys at that firms in the litigation
25 departments, with the same number of years of experience as myself and Mr. Safier are currently
26 billing at hourly rates in excess of \$1000 for law school graduates from 1994 and 1998. I also
27 believe the rates paid by Defendant to its firm in this case meets or exceeds the rates requested for
28 GSSLP. I believe that my firm's hourly rates are below market for attorneys with similar

1 backgrounds and experience.

2 36. Expenses are accounted for and billed separately and are not duplicated in my
3 professional billing rate. GSSLP has not received reimbursement for expenses incurred in
4 connection with this litigation. As of April 10, 2017, my firm incurred a total of \$65,902.06 in
5 unreimbursed actual third-party expenses in connection with the prosecution of these cases. The
6 actual expenses incurred in the prosecution of these cases are reflected on the computerized
7 accounting records of my firm prepared by bookkeeping staff, based on receipts and check
8 records, and accurately reflect all actual expenses incurred. Some of the expenses included below
9 are known to us but yet to be invoiced or have been invoiced but not yet paid. The expenses that
10 have yet to be invoiced, for example, include expenses for courtesy copies of this Motion and
11 expenses associated with traveling to the final approval hearing and are estimated based on my
12 experience. The expenses are as follows:

Expense Category	Amount
Copying, Duplication, Printing (E101)	
Arbitrators/Mediators (E121)	\$8,500
Court Fees (E112)	\$400
Delivery Svcs & Msgs (E107)	3,013.50
Deposition Transcripts (E115)	4,269.05
Experts (E119)	39,296.30
Litigation Sup Vendors (E118) ²	8,098.34
Local Travel (E109) ³	81.40
Meals (E111)	221.40
Online Research (E106)	191.64
Other (E124) ⁴	86.18

25
26 ² Logik Systems is a document review platform.

27 ³ Includes taxis, and parking, tolls, and mileage for automobiles owned by GSSLP timekeepers.

28 ⁴ Includes costs attributable to this case for the purchase of the product for testing, the purchase of a book about the olive oil industry, bookeeping services, online fax, and data hosting.

1	Out-of-Town Travel (E110)	1,162.58
2	Outside Printing (E102)	261.60
3	Postage (E108)	220.07
4	TOTAL	\$65,902.06

5 **D. Plaintiffs' Counsel Continuing Obligations to Class Members**

6 37. Following this Court granting preliminary approval to the Settlement, Class
7 Counsel established standardized procedures to ensure that all inquiries from Class Members were
8 timely and accurately handled. I am not aware of any feedback from class members that would
9 suggest that the process is onerous or complicated. Class Counsel also worked the Claim
10 Administrator to assure that settlement website functioned properly, was easy to use and properly
11 designed. Class Counsel also worked with the Claims Administrator to assure that notice was
12 disseminated in accordance with the terms of the Settlement Agreement. I received weekly updates
13 from the Claims Administrator regarding the administration of the settlement. GSSLP will
14 continue in this capacity should the settlement be finally approved. GSSLP will prepare for and
15 appear at the fairness hearing. If the settlement is approved and fees awarded, GSSLP also will
16 oppose any appeals that may be filed. Based on my experience with class actions, I additionally
17 anticipate that there will be another 50-75 hours of work before this Litigation is entirely complete
18 and an estimated 175-250 hours if this Court's judgment is appealed.

19
20 This declaration was executed this 11th day of April, 2017, at Berkeley, California. I state
21 the foregoing under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States.

22 /s/ Adam Gutride
23 Adam Gutride, Esq.

EXHIBIT 1

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
4/8/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prepare addendum to retention letter, related emails, meet with plaintiff	0.4	775.00	310.00
4/21/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Prepare draft complaint; review and revise the same.	2.4	750.00	1800.00
4/21/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re complaints, review	0.2	775.00	155.00
4/22/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Edit and research complaint	0.9	925.00	832.50
4/22/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and revise draft complaint	1.4	750.00	1050.00
4/23/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review edits to complaint; research same	0.5	925.00	462.50
4/23/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and revise complaint to included updated lab results	0.4	750.00	300.00
4/24/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Prepare draft CLRA declarations; prepare civil cover sheets and summons; communicate with co-counsel regarding complaints	0.5	750.00	375.00
5/5/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re draft complaint and strategy, review, revise and edit complaint	1.3	775.00	1007.50
5/6/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Revise and edit complaint, related emails	0.8	775.00	620.00
5/22/14	Seth Safier	Salov	finalize complaint; prep filing	3.0	925.00	2775.00
5/22/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re filing complaint, CLRA decl.	0.2	775.00	155.00
5/23/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Mag. Judge LaPorte; research Magistrate class and 12b6 decisions; discuss same with Seth Safier.	1.8	950.00	1710.00
5/23/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss Mag. Judge LaPorte with Adam Gutride.	0.3	925.00	277.50
5/23/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Finalize and file complaint; arrange for service	3.0	925.00	2775.00
5/23/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re filing complaint, CLRA decl., calls to client	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/27/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review and forward complaints; attention to service; edit and serve CLRA letters	1.2	925.00	1110.00
5/27/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and organize files from filing; prepare CLRA letters; calendar deadlines	1.0	750.00	750.00
5/29/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to service	0.5	925.00	462.50
5/29/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review emails re complaint filing, judges, calendar dates	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/30/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Prepare and gather documents for service; communicate with process server regarding the same	0.1	750.00	75.00
6/2/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re conf call	0.1	775.00	77.50
6/3/14	Seth Safier	Salov	file CLRA decl	0.3	925.00	277.50
6/4/14	Seth Safier	Salov	call with co counsel	0.2	925.00	185.00
6/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	discuss case with opposing counsel; research ItalFoods issues	1.0	925.00	925.00
6/11/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re ItalFoods, related research	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/19/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar - Stip to Extend Deadline to Answer, Discuss with Seth Safier .	0.5	950.00	475.00
6/19/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Conversation with opposing counsel Commons; Conversation with Adam Gutride & Marie McCrary;			
6/19/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review & Discuss Kumar - Stip to Extend Deadline to Answer.	0.3	925.00	277.50
6/19/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Attention to dates	0.1	775.00	77.50
6/19/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to stip and scheduling	0.4	925.00	370.00
6/20/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft and file; Salove Certificate of Interested Entities via ECF	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/20/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Conversation with opposing counsel Commons re Kumar - Stip to Extend Deadline to Answer; Discuss Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Certificate of Interested Entities with Kristen Smplicio; Review Kumar stip and Discuss with Marie McCrary.	1.4	925.00	1295.00
6/23/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review time sheet for Kristen Smplicio.	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/30/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research Salov labels, including Sagra oil; review complaint; research Italfoods	1.2	925.00	1110.00
7/10/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review DQ Cases.zip and Discuss with Marie McCrary.	2.0	950.00	1900.00
7/10/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research dismissal of ItalFoods	0.4	925.00	370.00
7/14/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	file Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Notice of Voluntary Dismissal in US District Court.	0.3	950.00	285.00
7/14/14	Seth Safier	Salov	discuss with A Gutride dismissal of ItalFoods or adding Sagra	0.4	925.00	370.00
7/14/14	Seth Safier	Salov	draft and file notice of voluntary dismissal	0.6	925.00	555.00
7/22/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and research Salov Motion to Dismiss; review complaint	1.4	950.00	1330.00
7/23/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research opposition to 12b6; call with co counsel	4.0	925.00	3700.00
7/23/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review briefs, related emails, prepare chart of arguments, call with co-counsel on matter.	0.6	775.00	465.00
7/25/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Begin drafting third party discovery	0.2	775.00	155.00
7/30/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re 26(f) conference	0.1	775.00	77.50
7/31/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Meeting with Collin W.; potential expert	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/4/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Call with Adam G. re case strategy, clear bottles and opposition briefs	0.7	925.00	647.50
8/4/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prep for and attend conference re rule 26(f) meeting and conference with Seth Safier re Kumar v. Salov; Review and revise briefs opposition briefs; discuss case & clear bottles w S. Safier	1.3	950.00	1235.00
8/4/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Jeff Kalie & Kristen Smplicio & revise 0-10CV61781_DocketEntry_09-13-2011_44; meeting and conference with Adam Gutride re Kumar v. Salov	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/4/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for and conduct rule 26f conf	1.3	925.00	1202.50
8/4/14	Todd Kennedy	Salov	call with Adam & Seth re orgin claims	0.4	850.00	340.00
8/5/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	coordinated meeting with co-counsel with Kristen Smplicio; Discuss geography of origin with Todd Kennedy and Seth Safier	0.7	950.00	665.00
8/5/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prepare for meeting 26(f) meeting with Kristen Smplicio; Discuss geography of origin with Adam Gutride & Todd Kennedy.	1.3	925.00	1202.50
8/5/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Research and draft opp to mtn to dismiss	4.5	775.00	3487.50
8/5/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Attention to dates re CMC, hearing and motions practice, status on stipulations, and other case mgmt issues	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/5/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call with co-counsel re brief strategy and related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/5/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Draft subpoenas, related emails re strategy	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/6/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Begin preparing list of discovery to request.	0.4	750.00	300.00
8/6/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to discovery requests	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/6/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	ADR call and related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/6/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Revise and edit third party subpoenas, related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/7/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review and research injunction standing issue; review draft insert of same	1.2	925.00	1110.00
8/7/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoenas	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/7/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Research and draft portions of opposition to mtn to dismiss	7.5	775.00	5812.50
8/7/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review and revise first set of draft discovery requests	0.3	925.00	277.50
8/8/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, and Discuss Kumar v Salov - GSLLP inserts to Opp to MTD; Email Service Stip; discuss same with K Smplicio	0.9	950.00	855.00
8/8/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoena strategy, begin organizing and preparing and formatting	1.5	775.00	1162.50
8/8/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Revise and edit portions of brief and related emails. research nationwide class issues	3.2	775.00	2480.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
8/8/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prepare e-service stip	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review 3rd party discovery requests	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research and review injunctive relief section for opp to motion to dismiss	0.9	925.00	832.50
8/10/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prepare subpoenas for service	0.8	775.00	620.00
8/10/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Research and draft portions of opp to mtn to dismiss	1.2	775.00	930.00
8/11/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, Discuss with Seth Safier, Anna Haac, Kristen Smplicio: opposition to motion to dismiss, amendments, "Issues to be Decided" section; 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Request for Judicial Notice (first draft); 2014.08.11 Notice of Appearance, H. Zavareei (Salov);2014.08.11 Notice of Appearance, J. Kaliel (Salov);	5.8	950.00	5510.00
8/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review & Discuss documents with Adam Gutride & Anna Haac re Kumar v Salov - GSLLP inserts to Opp to MTD (v5), 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (first draft)	3.7	925.00	3422.50
8/11/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Revise and edit brief, related emails re draft, opp to RFJN, etc	6.5	775.00	5037.50
8/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review revisions to motion to dismiss argument - injunctive relief	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/11/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and revise list of discovery needed; closely analyze Greek report and Safeway's claims regarding the same for determining whether their characterization of the report was accurate	0.5	750.00	375.00
8/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research Sagra EVOO, including corp.ownership	0.6	925.00	555.00
8/12/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review & revise 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (final); 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (final); file same; Research cases; Discuss with Kristen Smplicio.	6.2	950.00	5890.00
8/12/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Extensively Review Kumar v SALOV Email Service Stip (Sidley edits); Kumar - Joint Case Management Statement from Sidley; email with Kristen Smplicio re Draft Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion to Dismiss.	2.0	925.00	1850.00
8/12/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review, research and edit opposition to motion to dismiss	4.1	925.00	3792.50
8/12/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Revise and edit brief, related emails	10.0	775.00	7750.00
8/13/14	Seth Safier	Salov	revise final email service stip and Plaintiff's edit to the joint CMC statement, Email Collin W. at Sidley; Email Kristin Smplicio re formatting issues and re-filing procedures for 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss	3.5	925.00	3237.50
8/13/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	File Opposition/Response to Motion and Certificate of Interested Entities with District Court;	2.0	950.00	1900.00
8/13/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research and draft joint CMC statement	1.7	925.00	1572.50
8/13/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review Rule 11 motion and letter; draft response	0.8	925.00	740.00
8/13/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Misc case management issues - reformat and file brief, emails re stips and scheduling	0.8	775.00	620.00
8/13/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Begin drafting discovery requests.	0.7	750.00	525.00
8/14/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email Kristin Smplicio, Marie McCrary re re-filing procedures for 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (final); Email with Marie McCrary re EVOO Labeling requirements, esp. re country of origin vs. country of processing; Email with Seth Safier re amending complaint and filing an amended opposition; revise 2014.08.06 Pif's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (CORRECTED); Discuss timing of preliminary approval hearing; revise draft amended complaint	2.0	950.00	1900.00
8/14/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Conference with Adam Gutride re: Kumar v. SALOV North America: letter re factual misstatements from Sidley; email exchange with Sidley; email with Hassan Z re preliminary approval meeting;	1.3	925.00	1202.50
8/14/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research and review Rule 11 letter and motion	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/14/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	draft and review emails re errata to complaint	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/15/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and edit; research Salov - Errata to Complaint and Email Kristin Smplicio re salov opposition to MTD errata; Review & Email Seth Safier re #1 extra-p-750; # 3 Berio.jpg; # 2 bottle_robusto; # 5 FB EVOO; file Errata at US District Court; Review Opposition-Response to Motion; Discuss with Kristen Smplicio and draft email to Defendants re errata to the complaint and opposition to the motion to dismiss;	3.0	950.00	2850.00
8/15/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Conducted research on errata; Email Adam Gutride and Discuss #1 extra-p-750; # 3 Berio.jpg; # 2 bottle_robusto; # 5 FB EVOO; Discuss letter to Defendants with Kristen Smplicio.	1.5	925.00	1387.50
8/15/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research historic labels	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/15/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re errata, submit	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/16/14	Seth Safier	Salov	revise and Email to Sidley: Kumar - Joint Case Management Statement	0.2	925.00	185.00
8/17/14	Seth Safier	Salov	revise and Discuss Case Management Statement with Kristen Smplicio;	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/17/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review edits to CMC statement; discuss same internally	0.3	925.00	277.50
8/18/14	Seth Safier	Salov	file Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Joint Case Management Statement with District Court; revise CMC statement and initial disclosures;courtesy copy	2.1	925.00	1942.50
8/18/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Email Kristen Smplicio & Marie McCrary re discovery; Review & revise CMC statement and initial disclosures;	1.1	925.00	1017.50
8/18/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prepare initial disclosures, CMC statement, related emails	0.4	775.00	310.00
8/18/14	Seth Safier	Salov	edit and circulate revise CMC statement (joint); edit initial disclosures	0.8	925.00	740.00
8/18/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Continue drafting discovery requests	2.0	750.00	1500.00
8/19/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re olive oil RFPs	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/20/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Email Marie McCrary re labeling requirements; review and edit EVOO Interrogatories & RFPs (v4).	1.4	950.00	1330.00
8/20/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review discovery requests	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/21/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Email Marie McCrary re EVOO Interrogatories (v2), EVOO RFPs (v4).	0.6	950.00	570.00
8/21/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review email re rule 11; research cases cited	0.3	925.00	277.50
8/22/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, and Email EVOO Interrogatories (v2); discuss same with Seth Safier, Marie McCrary, and Kristin Smplicio.	0.5	950.00	475.00
8/22/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and Email Kristin Smplicio, Marie McCrary, and Adam Gutride re EVOO Interrogatories (v2), specifically re Safeway/Deoleo/Salov, esp. re third-party subpoenas.	0.3	925.00	277.50
8/22/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prepare third party subpoenas	1.7	775.00	1317.50
8/22/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Email re Rule 11 mtn	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/22/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to discovery	0.6	925.00	555.00
8/25/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prep for and attend CMC conference with Kristin Smplicio; draft response to Kumar v. SALOV North America: letter re factual misstatements; Review Plaintiff's First Set of Interrogatories to Defendant Salov (final); Plaintiff's First Set of RFPs to Defendant Salov (final) emails with Jeffrey Kaliel, Hassan Zavareei, Marie McCrary.	3.5	950.00	3325.00
8/25/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review . Plaintiff's First Set of Interrogatories to Defendant Salov; discuss overbreadth and burden problems with Adam Gutride, Marie McCrary, Jeffrey Kaliel	0.5	925.00	462.50
8/25/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Finalize and serve third party subpoenas	0.6	775.00	465.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
8/25/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re Rule 11 emails. Research glass bottles and review complaint errata.	0.6	775.00	465.00
8/25/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and revise discovery requests.	1.5	750.00	1125.00
8/25/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review discovery requests	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/26/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email Kristen Smplicio re Motion to Dismiss; Email Marie McCrary re Tariff Act in first draft of EVOO Complaints; Email Todd Kennedy re file storage protocol; Discuss breach of covenant with Seth Safier; review Salov reply papers in support of motion to dismiss	2.7	950.00	2565.00
8/26/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and research Salov reply brief on MTD	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/26/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoenas, review reply brief, related emails	0.4	775.00	310.00
8/26/14	Seth Safier	Salov	hearing prep; update case law	1.2	925.00	1110.00
8/27/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss research and decisions with Kristen Smplicio, Anna Haac, Seth Safier re dismissal of the contract claim.	0.5	950.00	475.00
8/27/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss research and decisions with Adam Gutride, Kristen Smplicio, Anna Haac re dismissal of the contract claim.	0.5	925.00	462.50
8/27/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review hearing write up; review 8th Cir Conagra decision	0.4	925.00	370.00
8/27/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research law re discovery stay; discuss same	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/28/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoenas	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/29/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Email re re discovery	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/29/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to 3rd party subpoenas; Albertson's	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/2/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and file Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Clerk's Notice Continuing Motion Hearing with US District Court;	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/2/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with opposing counsel re joint letter brie; revise and research Plaintiff's inserts to joint letter brief	1.3	925.00	1202.50
9/3/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Smplicio re Kumar v. Salov (Subpoena Typos).	0.5	950.00	475.00
9/3/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Ltr to Hon. Gonzalez Rogers re Discovery Stay and Discuss with opposing counsel	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/3/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re third party subpoenas and next steps, emails re discovery meet and confer, staging, etc; case strategy call	0.5	775.00	387.50
9/4/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and edit Ltr to Hon. Gonzalez Rogers re Discovery Stay and draft response; Email re to opposing counsel.	0.5	925.00	462.50
9/4/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails with co-counsel re letter brief on discovery stay	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/4/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prepare for meet and confer	1.5	925.00	1387.50
9/5/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	review and edit join stip re discovery deadlines	0.4	950.00	380.00
9/5/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss joint stip re discovery deadlines with Adam Gutride, Kristen Smplicio; Email with opposing counsel re draft stipulations; telephonic meet/confer with opposing counsel	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/5/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for and attend meet and confer	2.9	925.00	2682.50
9/5/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review Amazon responses to subpoena	0.2	925.00	185.00
9/6/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review stipulation and emails re meet and confer on matter	0.2	775.00	155.00
9/8/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	email with GSLLP attorneys re case status; joint stip and case documents	0.6	950.00	570.00
9/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and email discussion of Kumar - Joint Stipulation re Discovery deadlines (v2) with Adam Gutride; Prep for and attend conference with opposing counsel Collin W. re same.	1.4	925.00	1295.00
9/8/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoena strategy, review responses from retailers, research rule 45, draft letter. Emails re discovery stay and next steps	0.5	775.00	387.50
9/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	mtg with co counsel	1.0	925.00	925.00
9/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research and revise stipulation re discovery	1.2	925.00	1110.00
9/9/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Smplicio 3rd Party Subpoena Fee Schedule; conduct meet and confer (email) re SALOV from Sara Sudkamp (Attorney for Kroger); research Kroger's responses; research Kroger PPB	1.4	950.00	1330.00
9/9/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Kumar - Joint Stipulation re Discovery deadlines and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei; Email with Rod Mailer re trans-fats oil testing.	0.5	925.00	462.50
9/9/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re retailer subpoenas	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/9/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to draft stip	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/9/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review 3rd party subpoena objections	0.5	925.00	462.50
9/10/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Albertsons LLC Response Letter with Objections to Subpoena, from Kelly J Combs.	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/10/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Ltr to S Safier re subpoena objections and Discuss with Collin W..	0.4	925.00	370.00
9/10/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re discovery matters - subpoena issues, meet and confer on stay, etc	0.3	775.00	232.50
9/10/14	Seth Safier	Salov	discuss stipulation; research and draft insert to joint letter	5.4	925.00	4995.00
9/11/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss with Seth Safier: Ltr to Hon. Gonzalez Rogers re Discovery Stay (GSLLP redline).; Review 2014-09-11 Safeway Inc's Ltr Objections to Subpoena from Betsy Hilliard at Safeway.	1.0	950.00	950.00
9/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss with Adam Gutride: Ltr to Hon. Gonzalez Rogers re Discovery Stay (GSLLP redline).	0.6	925.00	555.00
9/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	draft and edit joint letter re discovery dispute; email opposing counsel	1.8	925.00	1665.00
9/12/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Ltr to Hon. Gonzalez Rogers re Discovery Stay; REDLINE Ltr re Stay with Adam Gutride & Collin W..	0.6	925.00	555.00
9/12/14	Seth Safier	Salov	finalize and email joint letter	0.5	925.00	462.50
9/12/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review edits to joint letter	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/15/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	finalize and have filed Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Discovery Letter Brief.	1.0	950.00	950.00
9/15/14	Seth Safier	Salov	edit final joint letter	0.4	925.00	370.00
9/16/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review objections and responses to third party subpoenas	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/17/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise Protective Order Salov (v1) & Discuss with Marie McCrary & Kristen Smplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/17/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Prepare draft protective order	0.4	750.00	300.00
9/17/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review protective order	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/17/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re protective order and next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
9/18/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and file Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order Referring Case to Magistrate Judge for Discovery.	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/18/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review order	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/19/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Email re hearing date on letter brief	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/19/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review discovery orders; review Judge Cousins order; research protective order requirements	0.7	925.00	647.50
9/23/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss Kumar v. Salov (Proposed Order) with Kristen Smplicio; revise same	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/23/14	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Strategy re division of labor with co-counsel; related emails and call with A. Silver	0.2	775.00	155.00
9/23/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research proposed order re motion for protective order and stay	0.5	925.00	462.50

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
9/24/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Revise and discuss revisions to protective order Marie McCrary; Review Salov Protective Order (v2 GSLLP); Review Kumar v Salov - Proposed Order First Discovery Letter Brief (v2); .	0.7	950.00	665.00
9/24/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review Proposed Order First Discovery Letter Brief (V1);revise Proposed Order First Discovery Letter Brief (v2); discuss same with Kristen Simpicio, Adam Gutride.	1.0	925.00	925.00
9/24/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review defendant's edits to protective order; correspondence regarding the same; Call with opposing counsel regarding protective order; circulate drafts re: the same	0.6	750.00	450.00
9/24/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Draft proposed order re mtn to stay; related emails; emails re protective order	1.3	775.00	1007.50
9/24/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Call with A. Silver re case status and division of labor, related emails	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/24/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research, review and edit proposed order re denying protective order	0.8	925.00	740.00
9/25/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Salov Protective Order (v4 Sidley) and Discuss with Marie McCrary.	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/25/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and Discuss Kumar / Protective Order with Marie McCrary.	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/25/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Call with opposing counsel regarding protective order; circulate drafts re: the same	0.4	750.00	300.00
9/26/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and approve Kumar v. Salov Proposed Order re Stay (final).	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/26/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Email discussion with Kristen Simpicio re Kumar v. Salov Proposed Order re Stau (v5).	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/26/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Revise and edit proposed order, related research, finalize and file, serve; related emails	2.1	775.00	1627.50
9/26/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review and revise proposed order re stay	2.8	925.00	2590.00
9/26/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review defendant's proposed order; revise plaintiff's proposed order	0.4	925.00	370.00
9/29/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, Discuss, and revise with Kristen Simpicio: Plaintiff's Notice of Supplemental Authority (v1); Review and Discuss w/ Marie McCrary: Motion for Entry of Protective Order (v1); Run comparison Protective Order.	1.0	950.00	950.00
9/29/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss standing to represent purchasers of products with Kristen Simpicio; research case law re same	1.5	925.00	1387.50
9/29/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Legal research for motion for entry of protective order and disputed portions; prepare draft motion; communicate with opposing counsel regarding the same	1.6	750.00	1200.00
9/29/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Prepare for hearing; review and organize cases and related emails; prepare notice of related authority, file, research new case law on issues	2.5	775.00	1937.50
9/29/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for hearing; review notice of recent authority	3.9	925.00	3607.50
9/29/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review order re protective order / stay	0.2	925.00	185.00
9/30/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review with Kristen Simpicio re motion to dismiss cases: 19 CFR 177.9 - Effect of ruling letters. ; Attend and argue at motion to dismiss; conference with S Safier re same and report to cocou	5.0	950.00	4750.00
9/30/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Conference with Adam Gutride re MTD hearing	0.4	925.00	370.00
9/30/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Hearing on mtn to dismiss (travel - 1.2), prep and related emails	2.2	775.00	1705.00
9/30/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for hearing on 12b6; travel to and from hearing; attend hearing	6.2	925.00	5735.00
10/1/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss and revise Kumar v. Salov -- draft protective order with Seth Safier.	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/1/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss and revise Kumar v. Salov -- draft protective order with Adam Gutride.	0.2	925.00	185.00
10/1/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attn to protective order dispute; email opposing counsel	0.5	925.00	462.50
10/1/14	Seth Safier	Salov	research nationwide contract certification in class case per Judge Roger's questions	0.7	925.00	647.50
10/1/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Email/discussion re objection to Cousin's order;	0.1	775.00	77.50
10/2/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss with opposing counsel Nitin Reddy: RE: Kumar v. Salov -- draft protective order.	0.5	950.00	475.00
10/2/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss draft protective order w Agutride	0.7	925.00	647.50
10/2/14	Seth Safier	Salov	discuss protective order issue with A. Gutride; strategize re case management	0.7	925.00	647.50
10/6/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and conference with Kristen Simpicio & opposing counsel re Salov objections to magistrate; prepare for same	0.5	950.00	475.00
10/6/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review email re magistrate	0.1	925.00	92.50
10/6/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Emails re objections to magistrate's order, strategy	0.2	775.00	155.00
10/7/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov -- draft protective order and Discuss with Marie McCrary, Kristen Simpicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
10/7/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss requirement of paper notices with Marie McCrary.	0.2	925.00	185.00
10/7/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Review responses/objections to retailer subpoenas, related emails re meet and confer	0.5	775.00	387.50
10/7/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Preparing objections to magistrate order; review local rules re: the same and sample orders; prepare draft; legal research re: standard for staying discovery	2.2	750.00	1650.00
10/8/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss AEO designation with Marie McCrary.	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/8/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Emails with M. McCrary re magistrate objections and case strategy	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	attention to protective order dispute; review Defendants' letter brief; research same	0.9	925.00	832.50
10/8/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Follow-up re: protective order; prepare revise joint motion for entry; discuss AEO designations with Adam	0.4	750.00	300.00
10/9/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with opposing counsel Nitin Reddy: Kumar v SNA - 10.9.2014 Letter from N. Reddy.	0.8	950.00	760.00
10/9/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discussion with Adam Gutride re Kumar v SNA - 10.9.2014 Letter from N. Reddy; research same	1.3	925.00	1202.50
10/9/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Emails re discovery stay and third party retailers	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/9/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review defense counsel letter re stay; research substance of letter; review Gutride response	0.4	925.00	370.00
10/10/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Revised and Discuss with Marie McCrary re Motion for Relief from Non-Dispositive Pretrial Order of Magistrate Judge; research same	0.4	950.00	380.00
10/10/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss with GSLLP attorneys obtaining relief from Mag Order	0.2	925.00	185.00
10/10/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and revise objections to magistrate order	1.0	750.00	750.00
10/13/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Marie McCrary: salov objection to magistrate.		950.00	0.00
10/13/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review and edit objection to magistrate order re stay	0.6	925.00	555.00
10/14/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	prepare for and attend mtg with expert on EVOO; travel to and from; meet with S. Safier after expert to discuss case	3.5	950.00	3325.00
10/14/14	Seth Safier	Salov	meet with expert	2.8	925.00	2590.00
10/14/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review and finalize motion challenging stay - Magistrate order	1.4	925.00	1295.00
10/14/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Review and revise objection to magistrate order; file same; review hearing transcript; prepare amended decl.; correspondence with A. Gutride re: the same	1.4	750.00	1050.00
10/15/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Emails re discovery stay and third party retailers. review correspondence, court order, objections to magistrate ruling, emails re protective order	0.6	775.00	465.00
10/16/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Finalize and file motion for entry and protective order	0.3	750.00	225.00
10/16/14	Kristen Simpicio	Salov	Review filing of protective order	0.1	775.00	77.50
10/17/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review information from US District Court on Kumar v. Salov.	0.1	950.00	95.00
10/20/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review court order re stay; discuss same internally	0.3	925.00	277.50
10/21/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Edit Motion Relief from Non-Dispositive Pre-Trial Magistrate order	1.0	950.00	950.00
10/21/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review order; discuss same with M. McCrary	0.2	925.00	185.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
10/21/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Follow-up with clerk's request re: word version of proposed protective order	0.3	750.00	225.00
10/21/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review court order on discovery stay, related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
10/22/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review subpoenas for Salov; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Protective Order.	0.6	950.00	570.00
10/22/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss with Marie McCrary re status of protective order.	0.2	925.00	185.00
10/29/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft response to Defendant's 'Objections to Plaintiff's First Requests for Production and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio.	1.3	950.00	1235.00
10/31/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review APL Letter to Seth Safier 10.31.2014; Ltr to Hon Kandis Westmore re Discovery Stay from Emily Culbertson at Sidley; Sch meet and confer with Sidley team re RPFs; discuss same w/ Kristen Semplicio.	1.4	950.00	1330.00
11/5/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re a letter brief regarding our proposed staging to Sidley.	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/6/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar - Updated Joint Case Management Statement (GSLLP inserts); (v1); Kumar - Updated Joint Case Management Statement.	0.8	950.00	760.00
11/6/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and edit - Updated Joint Case Management Statement from Collin W. at Sidley; research same	0.4	925.00	370.00
11/6/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit CMC; related emails	0.8	775.00	620.00
11/7/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise Kumar - Updated Joint Case Management Statement (GSLLP inserts ; 11.7.2104) with Kristen Semplicio.	0.6	950.00	570.00
11/7/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review / revise CMC statement	0.8	925.00	740.00
11/7/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit CMC; related emails	0.4	775.00	310.00
11/8/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	review email from Sidley re standing order	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/8/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Sidley re order	0.1	925.00	92.50
11/10/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar - Updated Joint Case Management Statement (GSLLP 11.10.20; 14); All_Judges_Standing_Rev_Aug_2014; Kumar - Updated Joint Case Management Statement (with Plaintiff; inserts, and added redlines).	0.8	950.00	760.00
11/10/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review final CMC statement	0.4	925.00	370.00
11/10/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit CMC; related emails; finalize, review filing	0.6	775.00	465.00
11/11/14	Seth Safier	Salov	review standing order	0.3	925.00	277.50
11/11/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Call with team re: settlement discussions	0.4	750.00	300.00
11/12/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Clerk's Notice.	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/12/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re CMC	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/13/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v Salov - CMC statement.	0.5	950.00	475.00
11/13/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review continuance notice for case management conference with Adam Gutride; Discuss setting up oil expert calls with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	925.00	185.00
11/20/14	Seth Safier	Salov	calls with damages experts	0.8	925.00	740.00
11/24/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re pricing; discuss expert with Adam G.	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/25/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss Sidley briefs with Kristen Semplicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
11/25/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review trade association case docket; download and review relevant briefs	0.3	775.00	232.50
12/2/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with co-counsel re case status and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/2/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for and attend con call with experts	0.8	925.00	740.00
12/9/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re conf call with cocounsel	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/10/14	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for and conduct call with co-counsel	0.2	925.00	185.00
12/10/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with co-counsel re case status and next steps, related emails	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/10/14	Marie McCrary	Salov	Team call	0.2	750.00	150.00
12/24/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar - 2nd Updated Joint Case Management Statement.	0.6	950.00	570.00
12/24/14	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Kumar CM edits	0.2	925.00	185.00
12/29/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar - 2nd Updated Joint Case Management Statement.	0.5	950.00	475.00
12/29/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review CMC statement; related emails; discuss same with Adam Gutride	0.2	775.00	155.00
12/30/14	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review expert proposals, revise Koller v Deoleo CMC statement and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio.	0.5	950.00	475.00
12/30/14	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re CMC statement	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/5/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Finalized Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Joint Case Management Statement Content.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/5/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	discuss case status ; conference with expert C Weir	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/5/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re CMC statement	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	discuss notice of supplemental authority in light of Koller v MedFoods	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise administrative motion to send to opposing counsel with Seth Safier, Kristen Semplicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
1/7/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review Gutride edits and revise administrative motion; discuss same with Adam Gutride	0.3	925.00	277.50
1/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review proposed notice of supplemental authority; review notes on MTD hearing	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/7/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review and discuss notice of recent authority	0.6	925.00	555.00
1/7/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prepare statement of recent decisions, related emails	0.4	775.00	310.00
1/8/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review CMC statement.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/8/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prepare and file admin mtn re recent decisions	0.4	775.00	310.00
1/13/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re nationwide case and subpoena of retailers.	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/13/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re lifting the stay on the Salov case; review and update case law	0.2	925.00	185.00
1/21/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	email with Gutride re Salov CMC statement and case schedule	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/21/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re Salov CMC.	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/21/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review case status with team	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/23/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Conference with Seth Safier re scheduling CMC.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/23/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Call Adam Gutride re scheduling CMC.	0.3	925.00	277.50
1/26/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Motion for Miscellaneous Relief.	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/26/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review and strategize with team re deposition notice; review correspondence re document productions	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/27/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review and edit Motion for Leave to File Statement of Recent Decision.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/27/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	attention to CMC statement, notice of 120 days on pending motion	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/29/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement Feb 9 CMC; Kumar v Salov - Notice Regarding Submitted Matters.	0.4	950.00	380.00
1/29/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review CMC statement; correspond K Semplicio re same	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/30/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	edit Joint Case Management Statement.	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/2/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review final CMC	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/2/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	finalize and re CMC statement; file same	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review order re 12b6; discuss same with S Safier; research same	1.2	950.00	1140.00
2/3/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and send to opposing counsel per court order, Updated Joint Case Management Statement	0.3	925.00	277.50

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
2/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review MTD order; email team re same	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/3/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review order on motion to dismiss; related emails re strategy	0.6	775.00	465.00
2/3/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review Court order re CMC and motion to dismiss; revise and circulate joint CMC statement	1.7	925.00	1572.50
			Email conversation with Hassan Zavareei re scheduling phone call; Review and Discuss with Seth Safier: Kumar - Joint stipulation re case management conference .	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/4/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Disuss CMC with A Gutride; revise stip re same	0.3	925.00	277.50
2/4/15	Seth Safier	Salov	prep for meet and confer; meet and confer; call with Sean Commons; review joint statement	1.3	925.00	1202.50
2/4/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review inquiry from media re MTD opinion and respond review Law360 article	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/4/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re call with co-counsel	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/5/15	Seth Safier	Salov	attn to continuance of CMC; review revise CMC statement	0.6	925.00	555.00
2/5/15	Seth Safier	Salov	read press reports on 12b6 order	0.5	925.00	462.50
2/5/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	attention to CMC issues	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Clerk's Notice.	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/12/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with expert and related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/12/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Sagra	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/12/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	email re adding Sagra brand to Salov complaint	0.2	950.00	190.00
			Review and revise Kumar - revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement; Redline - Kumar - revise Updated Joint Case Management Stat; ement; Kumar - revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement (Fe; b 25 CMC) (v3) with Kristen Semplicio.	0.6	950.00	570.00
2/17/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and disccss with Adam Gutride: Kumar v. SNA; review and revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement.	0.4	925.00	370.00
2/17/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit CMC statement; related emails, research on Sagra issue	0.6	775.00	465.00
2/17/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	edit CMC statement; teleconference R Brooke re Sagra brand	0.9	950.00	855.00
			Review Kumar - revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement; Redline - Kumar - revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement; Email re re discovery process with Kristen Semplicio.	2.0	925.00	1850.00
2/18/15	Seth Safier	Salov	revise CMC statement	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Revise and edit CMC statement; related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
2/18/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	review edits to CMC statement	0.4	925.00	370.00
2/18/15	Seth Safier	Salov	update team re case status, case management statement, class definition, Sagra brand oil testing	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/19/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Call with co-counsel; review case status, and attention to case/discovery management	0.6	775.00	465.00
2/20/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Edit Salov Schedule A; con call re same	1.0	950.00	950.00
2/20/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and Discuss Draft Salov Schedule A (v2) with Adam Gutride, Kristen Semplicio.	0.6	925.00	555.00
2/23/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Case management issues; prepare email re outstanding items and next steps on discovery	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Phone conference with Kristen Semplicio re third party subpoena questions and some questions about a discovery topic relating to price premium/damages; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Answer to Complaint.	0.8	950.00	760.00
2/24/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	strategize re Sagra brand case, edit IRI subpoena	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/24/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Emails re case management, Sagra, expert. etc	0.3	775.00	232.50
2/25/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	prepare for and Attend CMC; analyze possibility of amending re Sagra brand	2.1	950.00	1995.00
			Review answer; Call with A. Gutride, call with co-counsel re case management issues. Related emails.	0.9	775.00	697.50
2/25/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prep for calls. attn to doc management software issues.	1.7	775.00	1317.50
2/25/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	CMC. Travel (1 hr). related emails on issue.	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/26/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Salov 30(b)(6) Deposition Notice (v1).	0.5	775.00	387.50
2/26/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prepare subpoenas to experts. Prepare 30(b)(6) notice	0.4	950.00	380.00
3/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Silvia Ascarelli on Salov-Kumar case; update Safier re same	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/3/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with TZ re subpoenas, other assignments. Prepare depo notices	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Review Kumar-Objs and Rsp to RFP; Kumar-Objs and Rsp to Rogs from Sidley; Discuss email stip with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
3/4/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss email stip with Kristen Semplicio.	0.1	925.00	92.50
3/4/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review defendant discovery responses; request service on cocounsel	0.4	950.00	380.00
3/4/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Emails re defendants doc responses, assignments	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/5/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review and edit Case Management Conference statement; Discuss with Kristen Semplicio.	0.5	950.00	475.00
3/5/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review CMC order; calendar dates	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/6/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attn to rebuttal report for Salov; research same; local rules	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/9/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review case management order	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/10/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review Plaintiff's Notice of Subpoenas Salov 3.10 with Kristen Semplicio.		950.00	0.00
3/11/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Sidley about Kumar v. SALOV - Defendant's Objections and Responses.		925.00	0.00
			Review Kumar v SALOV Email Service Stip Amended; Kumar v SALOV Email Service Stip Amended redline; Kumar - Objs and Rsp to RFP (); Kumar - Objs and Rsp to Rog; discuss same with S. Safier and K. Semplicio	1.4	950.00	1330.00
3/12/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and discuss with team discovery responses and objections; research plaintiff purchases	1.0	925.00	925.00
3/12/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Call/email with A. Haac re meet and confer	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Review RFP objections, schedule phone conference with TZ, with Kristen Semplicio, Anna Haac, Seth Safier.	0.4	950.00	380.00
3/13/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	schedule telephone meet & confer with Sidley and Adam Gutride.	0.1	925.00	92.50
3/13/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Call with A. Haac re strategy and meet and confer. Related emails. Emails re case management, doc review software, etc.	0.9	775.00	697.50
3/13/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	review software, etc.	0.7	950.00	665.00
3/16/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Jeff Kaliel re 30(b)(6) deposition; prepare for same	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/17/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re meet and confer strategy	1.3	775.00	1007.50
3/18/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review meet and confer letter. Call with A. Haac re discovery responses and strategy	0.7	950.00	665.00
3/23/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio, Seth Safier re phone conference; Review and edit 2015.03.23 Kumar v. SNA - Meet and Confer Letter.	0.4	775.00	310.00
3/23/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review draft meet and confer letter; related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/23/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re meet and confer	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/25/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Emails re meet and confer, discovery protocol	1.0	925.00	925.00
3/26/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	prep for and conduct meet and confer			

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
3/26/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re meet and confer, e-discovery protocol. Review stip. Call with TZ re case management and next steps. Meet and confer call with opposing counsel	1.5	775.00	1162.50
3/27/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Meet/confer with opposing counsel	1.2	950.00	1140.00
3/27/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Calls with opposing counsel re RFP responses. Related emails/call with TZ	2.3	775.00	1782.50
3/30/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with TZ, related emails re next steps on meet and confer	0.4	775.00	310.00
4/1/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review 2015.03.25 Salov ESI Protocol;	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/1/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit search terms. Call with A Haac re revisions and next steps	1.2	775.00	930.00
4/2/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit search terms, ESI protocol, related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
4/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and edit Salov DRAFT Follow-Up Meet and Confer Letter	0.5	950.00	475.00
4/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review draft meet and confer letter	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/3/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit meet and confer letter, related emails	0.4	775.00	310.00
4/6/15	Marie McCrary	Salov	Discuss ESI proposal with Adam	0.2	750.00	150.00
4/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Proposed Salov ESI Protocol; discuss same w/ Marie McCrary	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/6/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re ESI protocol	0.2	775.00	155.00
4/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v. SNA.	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/7/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with A. Haac re Salov search strategy; related emails re next steps	0.6	775.00	465.00
4/8/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re meet and confer	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/13/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Calls/emails with A. Haac re search terms statusq	0.2	775.00	155.00
4/14/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Plaintiff's Notice of Subpoenas Salov 4.14.15.	0.6	950.00	570.00
4/14/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Research IRI and Nielsen subpoenas, prepare new ones	0.3	775.00	232.50
4/15/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	team discussion re case	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/15/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re meet and confer	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/16/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Robusto and Delicato types of EVOO and labeling country of origin; meet/confer call with opposing counsel; call with co-counsel	1.5	950.00	1425.00
4/16/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	correspond with K Semplicio re US / foreign production and control issues	0.3	950.00	285.00
4/16/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with TZ; call with opposing counsel re RFPs and search terms. review proposed search terms. Related emails	2.3	775.00	1782.50
4/17/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. SALOV - Defendant's First Set of Interrogatories, Requests from Sidley; Review depo transcript for the plaintiff and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
4/17/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re discovery requests	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/20/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review status of discovery; emails on assignments, next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
4/21/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, Discuss with Anna Haac, Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v. SALOV - Defendant's First Set of Interrogatories.		950.00	0.00
4/21/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review discovery requests and emails on assignments	0.2	775.00	155.00
4/22/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review Salov discovery requests - set No. 1	0.4	925.00	370.00
4/22/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review SNA _ Kumar first set of discovery requests (ROG, RFP, RFA) from Sidley.	0.7	950.00	665.00
4/28/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review & Discuss Kumar depo transcript with Seth Safier.	1.0	950.00	950.00
4/28/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss deposition transcripts with Adam Gutride.	0.3	925.00	277.50
5/1/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v Salov NA Subpoena to IRI from David Becker.	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/4/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review IRI proposal and Nielsen objections, emails re next steps. Emails re SALOV production and loading into Logikcull, next steps on review	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/5/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with D. Becker, C.Weir re IRI data; related emails re Nielsen and IRI. Review emails re search term; discuss with A. Haac	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review/edit draftLetter to J. Spero re discovery dispute	0.7	950.00	665.00
5/6/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with C. Weir, D. Becker re IRI subpoenas and expert data	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/7/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re IRI and Nielsen; bottle labels	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/8/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review email re depositions; response to same	0.4	925.00	370.00
5/8/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review report of hits on electronic document search and correspondence re same	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/11/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review report of meet/confer from A. Haac	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/12/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review SNA Search Term Results spreadsheet; discuss same with K.Semplicio	1.2	950.00	1140.00
5/12/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re predictive coding; discuss spreadsheet with A. Gutride	0.4	775.00	310.00
5/13/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and discuss exemplar RFA responses with Kristen Semplicio; edit and discuss Search and Review Process with Anna Haac and Sidley.	1.4	950.00	1330.00
5/13/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re predictive coding; responses to RFPs	0.2	775.00	155.00
5/14/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio Kumar v. SNA: Search and Review Process and status of Australian oil lab discuss	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/14/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review RFA responses; related emails re strategy	0.4	775.00	310.00
5/14/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	edit draft responses to RFAs	0.8	950.00	760.00
5/14/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call w D. Becker re IRI data; Call with Nielsen. Review cases and from Nielsen and other research re possible mtn to compel. Related emails.	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/15/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: 2015.05.13 Salov_ Response to Requests for Admissions (draft)	0.5	950.00	475.00
5/15/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit discovery responses. Related emails	3.6	775.00	2790.00
5/15/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	review and edit responses to interrogatories and RFPs	0.6	950.00	570.00
5/17/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with Plaintiff re discovery responses. Revise and edit email re Kumar v Salov: responses to rogs and rfps; Review and finalized Salov_ Plaintiff's Response to Requests for Admissions (final); Salov_ Plaintiff's Response to Requests for Production of Documents (final); Salov_ Plaintiff's Response to First Set of Interrogatories (final); review same	0.4	775.00	310.00
5/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Calls/emails re IRI data, expert strategy	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/18/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review, finalize, file and serve discovery responses	1.8	775.00	1395.00
5/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	edit responses to requests for production; edit responses to interrogatories	1.2	950.00	1140.00
5/22/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. SNA: Search and Review Process.	0.6	950.00	570.00
5/22/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review articles on NCL olive oil test, related emails	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/26/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with C. Weir; emails re next steps on IRI data. Emails/research re NCL olive oil study and olive oil conference.	0.2	775.00	155.00
5/27/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re doc production, EVOO conference.	0.2	775.00	155.00
5/29/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Gather, review and prepare docs for plaintiff's production; related emails. Review email re conference notes.	0.6	775.00	465.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
5/31/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei: 2016.01.19 HAZ Supp Declaration ISO Class Cert (Salov) ajg			
			edits copy; supplemental declaration of adam gutride ISO class cert	4.0	950.00	3800.00
6/1/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review emails re olive oil seminar, IRI, coordinate call with TZ	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/2/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call with TZ; coordinate IRI contract	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/3/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re plaintiff's responses to discovery	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/4/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Kumar v. SNA - plaintiff's discovery responses with Kristen Smplicio;	0.2	950.00	190.00
6/4/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re plaintiff production, review status of docs produced	0.4	775.00	310.00
			Discuss Fortune.com Story on Kumar v. Salov with Kristen Smplicio; phone conference with author Mark			
6/9/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Koba; prepare for same; research M Koba	1.2	950.00	1140.00
6/9/15	Seth Safer	Salov	Discussion with Kristen Smplicio re videographer for deposition.	0.2	925.00	185.00
6/9/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re Fortune article	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/10/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Attn to discovery: emails/strategy re IRI data, other docs to produce, next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
			revise discovery responses and Discuss with Kristen Smplicio; Email with Fortune.com Story on Kumar v.			
6/11/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Salov author; Review Combined Olive Oil Response for Gutride Saifer LLP - June 2015; Salov Production			
			6.11.2015.zip.	0.4	950.00	380.00
6/11/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Calls/emails re doc production and testing	0.3	775.00	232.50
			Email with Seth Safer, Kristen Smplicio re Kumar v Salov - update on Plaintiff's responses to RFPs;			
6/12/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review brands that failed NCL test results with team.	0.7	950.00	665.00
6/12/15	Seth Safer	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride, Kristen Smplicio re Kumar v Salov - update on Plaintiff's responses to RFPs	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/12/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re responses to discovery, Rule 11 threats	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/19/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re Rule 11 mtn	0.1	775.00	77.50
6/24/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prep for call; emails re Fortune article	0.3	775.00	232.50
6/25/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call with TZ re strategy	0.4	775.00	310.00
6/26/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Coordinate document production; related emails	0.5	775.00	387.50
6/29/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review case status; call with TZ re assignments and next steps. Emails re search and review process	0.4	775.00	310.00
7/1/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review meet and confer letter; email with A Haac	0.1	775.00	77.50
7/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Salov - July 6 Errata to Complaint (v1); revise response to Rule 11 letter	0.8	950.00	760.00
7/6/15	Seth Safer	Salov	review and edit response to rule 11 070715 v2	0.8	925.00	740.00
7/6/15	Seth Safer	Salov	review and edit response to Rule 11 letter	0.6	925.00	555.00
7/6/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re Rule 11; review complaint, prepare errata and produce additional test results	1.8	775.00	1395.00
			Email with Nitin Reddy at Sidley re Kumar v Salov response to rule 11 070715 (final); Salov - July 7 Errata			
7/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	to Complaint (070715 final).	0.2	950.00	190.00
			Email with Sean Commons at Sidely re Kumar v. SNA: Rule 11 Motion; Email with Kristen Smplicio re			
7/8/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Kumar v. SNA: Rule 11 Motion.	0.4	950.00	380.00
7/8/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review Rule 11 letter; related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
7/9/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Smplicio re basis for an adverse inference instruction.	0.1	950.00	95.00
7/9/15	Seth Safer	Salov	Email with Kristen Smplicio re spoliation instruction.	0.1	925.00	92.50
7/9/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call with A. Haac re next steps. review various letters. Related emails	0.4	775.00	310.00
7/10/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re Rule 11 and testing	0.1	775.00	77.50
7/13/15	Seth Safer	Salov	Email with Kristen Smplicio re upcoming Deoleo depo.	0.1	925.00	92.50
7/13/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re doc production; logikcull; finalize and serve 30(b)(6) notice	0.5	775.00	387.50
7/14/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Smplicio re Kumar v. SNA: Search and Review Process	0.1	950.00	95.00
7/14/15	Seth Safer	Salov	Email re Kumar v. SNA: letter re discovery.	0.1	925.00	92.50
7/15/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re doc production and testing; rule 11 mtns, locate documents previously produced, etc	0.4	775.00	310.00
7/16/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re doc production; reproduce; produce docs without redactions, etc	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/20/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re unredacted reports; review same	0.3	950.00	285.00
7/20/15	Marie McCrary	Salov	Search for and prepare expert emails for privilege log; communicate with Kristen re the same.	0.5	750.00	375.00
7/20/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call with co-counsel re doc production; email re logikcull	0.4	775.00	310.00
7/21/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	discuss document review in Salov with Gutride	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/21/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Troubleshoot issues in logikcull. Call with TZ	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Discuss Berio and Pompeian Pricing Activity 4-2010.pptx; titled(2) 105751 spreadsheet; titled(1) 105750			
7/22/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	spreadsheet with Kristen Smplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
7/22/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Logikcull troubleshooting. Call/emails with A. Haac re next steps in case.	0.4	775.00	310.00
7/27/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Draft to do list, schedule call with TZ	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Call with A Silver and A Haac re case management issues, other assignments; Call with C. Weir re expert			
7/29/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	report. Other related emails	0.6	775.00	465.00
7/30/15	Seth Safer	Salov	OO strategy call	0.3	925.00	277.50
7/30/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call with co-counsel re case management issues	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/31/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Misc case management issues: emails re label gathering and subpoenas; new testing; etc	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Anna Haac re Depositions in SNA.	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/3/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re CMC, doc production status	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/4/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Email re doc production	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/5/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re case status and docs; Logikcull maintenance.call with TZ doc reviewer	0.4	775.00	310.00
8/11/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re Logikcull	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/17/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Logikcull maintenance; emails re depo dates and case strategy	0.4	775.00	310.00
8/18/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re depo dates; update to plaintiff	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/19/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Call re class cert strategy; scheduling issues, next steps	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/20/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Kumar v. SNA - Dates for Deposition with Kristen Smplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/20/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re strategy, depos, docs on logikcull, other case matters	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/21/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re depos	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/24/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re plaintiff depo scheduling	0.6	775.00	465.00
8/28/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss with Kristen Smplicio: scheduling meet and confer with opposing counsel re extension	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/28/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Logikcull maintainance. Call with TZ re tagging, other case management issues. Emails re scheduling.	0.6	775.00	465.00
9/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Salov - depos and class cert schedule with Kristen Smplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/3/15	Seth Safer	Salov	case strategy discussion with Smplicio; Gutride	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/3/15	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	case call with Adam and Seth	0.3	775.00	232.50
9/3/15	Seth Safer	Salov	review email; discuss strategy re discovery; review documents	2.5	925.00	2312.50
9/4/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Salov DRAFT Meet-and-Confer RE Discovery and Scheduling Letter	0.5	950.00	475.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
9/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Revise updated DRAFT Meet-and-Confer RE Discovery and Scheduling (v3)	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/7/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review M&C letter draft	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/8/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review meet and confer letter	0.2	925.00	185.00
9/15/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Salov - extension strategy with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/17/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Sidley re Kumar v. SNA - Call Re: Discovery Extension; Email with Hassan Zavareei re Kumar - Confidential Settlement Communication; discuss same w S Safier	0.7	950.00	665.00
9/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v. SNA - Dates for Plaintiff's Deposition.	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/18/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Attention to depo dates	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/21/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re re research status and third party subpoena to Deoleo in Salov	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/23/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Salov - Defendant's depos.	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/23/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Kumar v. SNA - Call Re: Discovery Extension.	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/24/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v Salov - Plaintiff's production; prepare with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v. SNA - Meet and Confer Regarding Depositions.	1.5	950.00	1425.00
9/24/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Meet and Confer Regarding Depositions; discuss with Kristen	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/25/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Responded to Kumar v. SNA - Meet and Confer Request Regarding Depositions; Discuss Salov - plaintiff depo dates with Kristen Semplicio; call with co-counsel	0.5	950.00	475.00
9/27/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with TZLegal to discuss: Salov -- Legal Standard for Hague Letter of Request.	0.4	950.00	380.00
9/28/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with TZLegal Re: Salov deposition notices	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/29/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Anna Haac: 2015.03.25 Salov ESI Protocol; Review and discussed with Kristen Semplicio: Salov 30(b)(6) Deposition Notice (final); Email with Kristen Semplicio to discuss Re: Salov - plaintiff depo dates.	0.4	950.00	380.00
9/30/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review recent olive oil tests from Rod Mailer; Review and discussed Kumar v Salov - Second Stip Continuing Class Certification (v2) with Anna Haac.	0.3	950.00	285.00
10/1/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and discussed with Anna Haac: Kumar v Salov - Second Stip Continuing Class Certification (v3).	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/1/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Stipulation for add'l time, revise; finalize and file; related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/2/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Send proposed order re stip; related emails re scheduling, depositions, class cert strategy. Review meet and confer letter; ascertainability emails, etc	1.0	775.00	775.00
10/5/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with A. Gutride re strategy; related emails. Logikcull maintenance. Depo coordination	0.7	775.00	542.50
10/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference re Kumar v. SNA - Supplemental Interrogatory Responses and FTP with Anna H; prepare for same; review Supp responses	1.0	950.00	950.00
10/6/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attn to discovery matters. Call with S. Commons. Call with A. Haac. Call with A. Silver. Review rog responses. Emails re status of case and strategy. Calendar new dates	3.8	775.00	2945.00
10/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Anna Haac: SNA Discovery Letter; Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Olive Oil Label Spreadsheet 10.7.15 spreadsheet; 2015.10.7- Interrogatory No. 9 spreadsheet.	2.2	950.00	2090.00
10/7/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re strategy. Work on letter re letter to hague and discovery dispute letter. Call with A. Haac.	1.2	775.00	930.00
10/8/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to discovery. Revise letter of request; prepare joint letter brief re docs from parent. related emails re scheduling.	2.3	775.00	1782.50
10/9/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review SNA - Ntc of Subpoenas001 from Sidley; Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Kumar v. SNA - Dates for Deposition.	0.4	950.00	380.00
10/9/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review ECF notice; discuss same with Kristen S.	0.3	925.00	277.50
10/9/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to discovery. Revise letter of request; prepare joint letter brief re docs from parent. related emails re declaration, admin motion, depo scheduling, subpoenas; discuss case notice with Safier, S.	5.5	775.00	4262.50
10/12/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss ECF notice with Team	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/12/15	Seth Safier	Salov	review ECH notice	0.1	925.00	92.50
10/12/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoena response; depo prep	0.2	775.00	155.00
10/13/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v Salov - Jt Letter to Cousins re discovery from parent (v2); Salov -- Proposed Letter of Request (v4).	2.0	950.00	1900.00
10/13/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Kumar v. SNA - Updated Deposition Notice Rohini Kumar; Kumar v. SNA - Updated Deposition Notice Vijesh Unnikrishnan; research spousal privilege	1.1	925.00	1017.50
10/13/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to discovery. Logikcull issues. Call/emails re depo prep. Revise and edit letter motions; related emails	1.3	775.00	1007.50
10/14/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Jeffrey Kalie re Subpoena to NCL; Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Kumar v Salov- admin motion for more time.	0.5	950.00	475.00
10/14/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Ltr. to A. Haac from S. Commons 10.14.15, Salov -- Proposed Letter of Request (10.14.15); Kumar v Salov - Jt Letter to Cousins re discovery from parent (Pltf 10.14.2015); prepare for call	0.6	925.00	555.00
10/14/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Case management issues - finalize letter brief to send to opposing counsel; emails re declaration, exhibits, related docs. emails re doc production. Draft admin mtn for additional time. revise and edit declaration.	6.5	775.00	5037.50
10/15/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Hassan Zavareei re Re: NCL Motion to Quash and new plaintiffs.	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/15/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re new plaintiffs.	0.1	925.00	92.50
10/15/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Case management - revise declaration of A Haac; emails re doc production and logikcull issue; calls/emails re motion for an extension; other strategy matters	2.0	775.00	1550.00
10/16/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Hassan Zavareei re NCL Motion to Quash; finalize same	4.0	950.00	3800.00
10/16/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Case management - prepare to do list; assign tasks, related emails re subpoena responses, depo prep strategy. attention to new documents, logical maintenance. Related emails/calls.	2.2	775.00	1705.00
10/17/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Rogers certifying the EVOO claim; review documents	5.4	925.00	4995.00
10/17/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review documents	6.5	775.00	5037.50
10/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Kristen Semplicio re Salov- Overview of 10/13/15 production.		950.00	0.00
10/18/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review documents	5.5	775.00	4262.50
10/19/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: National Consumers' League test results; call with TZ re depositions	0.5	950.00	475.00
10/19/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and discussed with Kristen Semplicio: 2015.10.19 DRAFT Salov 30b6 and Mueller Outline.	0.2	925.00	185.00
10/19/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Misc matters. Review documents. Call with A. Gutride and S. Safier re strategy. Call with TZ re strategy. Related emails. Depo prep and coordinate with plaintiff. NCL subpoena response.	5.5	775.00	4262.50
10/20/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Jeffrey Kalie re Re: Filippo Berio damages; phone conference with Kristen Semplicio re Salov - NCL subpoena response.	0.6	950.00	570.00
10/20/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Draft objections and responses to NCL subpoena; related calls/emails.	2.8	775.00	2170.00
10/20/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Calls/emails re depo prep	0.2	775.00	155.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
10/21/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and disccsd with Jeff Kaliel and Hassan Zavareei: Kumar v Salov NCL Response to Subpoena (v2);			
			Email with Nitin Reddy re Re: Kumar - Service of subpoena on Gutride Safier LLP.	0.6	950.00	570.00
10/21/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Misc emails re depo strategy, labels, subpoena responses, related calls, etc	1.2	775.00	930.00
10/22/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Andrew Silver re Salov - labels.		950.00	0.00
10/22/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Misc emails re class cert, depositions, depo prep scheduling etc	0.4	775.00	310.00
10/23/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise imported from italy v2 as of 2015.10.7- Interrogatory No. 9-2 spreadsheet; email conversation with Rod Mailer re Re: review of testimony..	1.2	950.00	1140.00
10/23/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prep R. Kumar for depo; emails re depo start time	1.2	775.00	930.00
10/24/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Jaya Gupta re deposition; prep plaintiff for depo	1.5	950.00	1425.00
10/24/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prep V. Unnikrishnan; related discussion with A. Gutride	1.3	775.00	1007.50
10/25/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re strategy	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/26/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	call with N Ready re subpoena; prep for same	0.8	950.00	760.00
10/26/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss salov subpoenas w Gutride	0.8	925.00	740.00
10/26/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Misc matters: coordinate depo issues, doc production and logikcull issues, letter of request, call with R Kumar, subpoenas to GSLLP and TZ, etc	2.0	775.00	1550.00
10/27/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Attend and defend deposition of plaintiff; Review and Email with Kristen Semplicio re Engagement Agreement (Rohini Kumar) EVOO (v1); Kumar addendum; travel; discuss same with Safier	11.0	950.00	10450.00
10/27/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Coordinate with co-counsel and opposing counsel re withdrawal of motions; discuss depo with Adam G	0.7	925.00	647.50
10/27/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re doc production; logikcull maintenance. Call with A. Silver re doc review, depo prep, misc matters	0.7	775.00	542.50
10/27/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Calls/emails re engagement agreement; locate, redact and produce	0.7	775.00	542.50
10/28/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re document production, depo prep, class cert, etc	0.4	775.00	310.00
10/28/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prep V. Unnikrishnan; related emails	0.9	775.00	697.50
10/29/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert, depo, etc; depo prep	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/30/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Anna Haac re Tycko Subpoena Notice 10.23.15; confer K Semplicio re V. Unnikrishnan depo	0.1	950.00	95.00
10/30/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Defend deposition of V. Unnikrishnan; prep and travel	4.8	775.00	3720.00
10/30/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails/calls re depo and class cert strategy	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/31/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Attention to Scheduled re motion for class certification.	0.3	950.00	285.00
11/2/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Anna Haac re Re: Kumar v Salov: Subpoena to GSLLP.	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/2/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to discovery/case management - discussions/emails re depositions, experts, class cert assignments. Third party subpoena issues. Logikcull maintenance. Review recent briefs, correspondence, etc re assignments and strategy. Attn to dates. Spoliation letter.	0.5	775.00	387.50
11/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Anna Haac, Hassan Zavareei re Re: FW: Kumar v Salov: Subpoena to GSLLP.	0.6	950.00	570.00
11/3/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review motion for letter of request; email re assignments	0.3	775.00	232.50
11/4/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re depositions, assignments, case strategy and spoliation. Attention to other case management issues. Begin drafting objections and responses to RFPs. Related emails	2.2	775.00	1705.00
11/5/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re Re: Kumar v. SNA - Letter Regarding Spoliation of Evidencel review and research same	1.0	950.00	950.00
11/5/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Kumar v. Salov response to letter re evidence spoliation (v1).	0.8	925.00	740.00
11/5/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to discovery and strategy. Review motion for letter of request, other pending documents. Emails re strategy on EVOO class, next steps in case. Begin outline of opposition. Revise and edit draft RFPs. Draft letter re spoliation. Related emails.	3.5	775.00	2712.50
11/6/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov- draft responses to 3rd RFPs.; call with TZ re strategy; preparation	1.0	950.00	950.00
11/6/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Conversation with Adam Gutride Re: Salov plaintiff		925.00	0.00
11/6/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Case strategy. Call with TZ re subpoenas, settlement, and class cert. Review upcoming deadlines and tasks. Coordinate class cert strategy, letter brief strategy, etc. Finalize and serve RFP responses	3.4	775.00	2635.00
11/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with C Weir re Salov (Filipo Berio) Class Cert.	0.2	950.00	190.00
11/7/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re spoliation letter, case management issues	0.2	775.00	155.00
11/9/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov (Filipo Berio) Class Cert; call with S Commons re spoliation	1.0	950.00	950.00
11/9/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conferece with Kristen Semplicio Re: Rohini's receipts	0.2	925.00	185.00
11/9/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Case management. Call re class cert strategy. emails re receipts, subpoenas, stay in case, settlement, other next steps. Review emails from Weir and discuss with A. Silver.	1.4	775.00	1085.00
11/10/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re: Kumar v Salov- Defendant's second set of RFPs.	0.4	950.00	380.00
11/10/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re case strategy and settlement. Emails re Weir declaration and class cert strategy. Discussions re confidentiality of labels and spreadsheet used by Weir. Other discussions /emails/doc review re class cert. Call/emails with TZ re Salov doc productions and Logikcull issues. Research into missing RFPs.	3.5	775.00	2712.50
11/11/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Jaya Gupta re (11.11.15) Ltr Re Confidentiality Designations 30(b)(6) Depo; (11.11.15) Ltr Re Confidentiality Designations T, Mueller Individual Depo; review transcripts	3.3	950.00	3135.00
11/11/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Class cert strategy. Emails re class definition and EVOO class. Review depo testimony. Other emails re subpoenas and case management issues.	1.3	775.00	1007.50
11/12/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Andrew Silver re RE: Salov Mailer Declaration; Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov- GSLLP subpoena response; discuss same	0.7	950.00	665.00
11/12/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review stip; related emails re stay and strategy. Emails re class cert and class definition. Review rog and hot docs responses. Email and call with A. Silver.	1.5	775.00	1162.50
11/13/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	discuss responses to subpoenas to GSLLP and TZ	0.3	950.00	285.00
11/13/15	Seth Safier	Salov	responses to subpoenas to GSLLP and TZ	0.3	925.00	277.50
11/13/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re subpoenas, stipulation on stay, other case stragey matters. Call with Colavita re labels. Emails re class cert brief and strategy. Discussion re confidentiality issues	0.8	775.00	620.00
11/16/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Read and correct deposition transcript	3.0	950.00	2850.00
11/17/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re stay in case. Other case management issues and assignments	0.3	775.00	232.50
11/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Salov - depo transcripts/corrections from Kristen Semplicio.	0.4	950.00	380.00
11/18/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re depo transcript	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/20/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Re: Kumar v. Salov (Kumar DEpo Trans).	0.3	925.00	277.50
11/20/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re depo transcripts. Calendar corrections date	0.2	775.00	155.00
11/23/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Misc case management issues. review docs produced to date. Emails re confidentiality	0.4	775.00	310.00
11/24/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re confidentiality	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/30/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise - opp to Salov motion, depo corrections.	2.2	950.00	2090.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
11/30/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review motion; emails re assignments, next steps in case	0.3	775.00	232.50
12/1/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss - opposition to the motion to stay with Kristen S.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/1/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review motion to stay; related emails, call with A. Gutride re opposition	0.3	775.00	232.50
12/2/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: New York Plaintiff; Email with Jaya Gupta re Re: Kumar v. SNA - Deposition Corrections.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/2/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re depo corrections, motion to stay, next steps in case	0.3	775.00	232.50
12/3/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Kristen Semplicio, Seth Safier re Salov stipulation to continue briefing on motion to stay.	1.0	950.00	950.00
12/3/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Call with Adam Gutride, Kristen Semplicio re Salov stipulation to continue briefing on motion to stay	1.0	925.00	925.00
12/3/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call/emails with A. Silver re motion to stay and other outstanding issues in case; related emails. Review motion. Call with A. Gutride and S. Safier re case strategy and stipulation	1.0	775.00	775.00
12/7/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: ORDER by Judge Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers Denying [73] Stipulation to Continue Briefing and Hearing on Defendant's Motion to Stay.	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/7/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review court order, A. Silver motion. Emails and calls re strategy on opposition to motion to stay and next steps. Emails re confidentiality and IRI issues. Revise and edit draft motion	1.8	775.00	1395.00
12/8/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit opposition to motion to stay. Related research on 9th Cir cases. Related emails	3.5	775.00	2712.50
12/9/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Salov -- DRAFT Opp to Mot to Stay (v4) (as)	1.3	950.00	1235.00
12/9/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit opp to motion to stay; related emails re confidentiality issues, IRI, strategy. Coordinate filing	3.0	775.00	2325.00
12/10/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Coordinate courtesy copies	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/14/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Review invoice for Kumar depo trans with Adam Gutride.	0.1	925.00	92.50
12/15/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov - depo corrections.	0.1	950.00	95.00
12/15/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Email re order denying stay.	0.1	925.00	92.50
12/15/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review order; related emails re strategy	0.3	775.00	232.50
12/16/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Phone conference re - outstanding subpoenas.	0.1	925.00	92.50
12/16/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re dissolution of stay; related emails re strategy and subpoenas, review ECF filing re motion for issuance of letter of request	0.4	775.00	310.00
12/17/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Weir depo prep	2.0	950.00	1900.00
12/18/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Olive Oil label collection update.	0.1	950.00	95.00
12/18/15	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss outstanding subpoenas w co-counsel	0.1	925.00	92.50
12/18/15	Seth Safier	Salov	call re stay	1.0	925.00	925.00
12/18/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Strategy call with TZ re next steps in case. Related emails and prep for call.	1.2	775.00	930.00
12/19/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Mitchell Weinberg Resume 12-2015 re expert witness.	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/21/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Matt McCrary re Re: Weir Deposition.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/21/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re next steps in case	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/22/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone call with Sean Commons re outstanding subpoenas; prep for same	0.5	950.00	475.00
12/22/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re stipulation, settlement, and subpoenas. Attention to case management, class cert issues, other matters	0.5	775.00	387.50
12/23/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Nitin Reddy re Re: Kumar - outstanding subpoenas.		950.00	0.00
12/23/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re stipulation and subpoenas	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/27/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re Draft Stipulation to dismiss EVOO claims; draft and revise stip; research same	0.8	950.00	760.00
12/28/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v Salov: EVOO claims; subpoenas.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/29/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re opposition to motion for a letter of request.	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/29/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review motion for letter of request; emails re opposition and annotated letter; strategy re stay, other issues. Draft response	1.2	775.00	930.00
12/30/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and edit Opp to Mtn for LOR (v1).		950.00	0.00
12/30/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Draft, revise and edit opposition to motion for letter of request. Gather documents for declaration. Finalize and file. Other case management issues re class cert/Weir declaration; EVOO stip, etc.	4.5	775.00	3487.50
12/31/15	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discussion with Andrew Silver re RE: Salov: Draft Stipulation to dismiss EVOO claims, RE: Salov wholesale unit sales.	0.6	950.00	570.00
12/31/15	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review emails/docs re class cert and Weir decl; related emails re EVOO dismissal stipulation; emails re motion for letter of request	0.8	775.00	620.00
1/4/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Andrew Silver re RE: Salov (Filipo Berio) Class Cert.	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/4/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert strategy and olive oil segment on 60 minutes	0.5	775.00	387.50
1/5/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Call with TZ re strategy; Email discussion with Kristen Semplicio re whether the various scents or flavors that comprise IRI categories were material to purchasing decisions; draft Salov stipulation to dismiss claims regarding EVOO v.2; Discuss with Sean Commons.	1.7	950.00	1615.00
1/5/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with TZ re case strategy and next steps; related emails re class cert, subpoenas, etc	1.0	775.00	775.00
1/6/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with team: Salov stipulation to dismiss claims regarding EVOO v 2.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/6/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re case strategy. Review stip. Emails re stip, class cert issues, Mailer depo, etc	0.2	775.00	155.00
1/7/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Finalize stip. related emails. File	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/8/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Olive Oil Buyers Drop 'Extra Virgin' Claims In False Ad Row; Review and Discuss with Colin W; order granting stip to dismiss EVOO claims.	0.6	950.00	570.00
1/8/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Salov class cert.	0.1	925.00	92.50
1/8/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails with C. Weir re depo and next steps. Review email from A. Silver and draft, emails with A. Gutride re class cert	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/8/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review transcripts for R. Kumar, V. Unnikrishnan for corrections	3.0	775.00	2325.00
1/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss setting up a call with Andrew Silver with Colin Weir	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief	5.0	775.00	3875.00
1/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss with Andrew Silver: Kumar v. SNA -- SNA's supplemental interrogatory response.	0.4	950.00	380.00
1/12/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief; related emails, call with A. Silver. Emails re catalyst theory and case strategy	3.8	775.00	2945.00
1/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and edit DRAFT Motion for Class Certification (v2); Review Mueller B. Thomas Decl 10-21-2015.	4.2	950.00	3990.00
1/13/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Class cert brief revisions and related emails, prepare corrections to depo transcripts, other emails	2.7	775.00	2092.50
1/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Jaya Gupta re Kumar v. SNA - Mueller (30(b)(6)) Deposition Errata; Kumar v. SNA - Mueller (Individual) Deposition Errata; Kumar v. SNA - Scheiber Deposition Errata; Kumar v. SNA - Stryker-Rodda Deposition Errata; Kumar v. SNA - Mosca Deposition Errata.	2.6	950.00	2470.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
1/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, and Discuss Salov -- DRAFT Motion for Class Certification (v5); with Kristen Simplicio, Seth Safier	2.8	950.00	2660.00
1/15/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Read and revise DRAFT Motion for Class Certification (v5)	2.1	925.00	1942.50
1/15/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief; emails re next steps	3.2	775.00	2480.00
1/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Conference with Andrew Silver re TZ needs to assemble all the declarations and exhibits Re: Salov class cert. exhibits.	0.5	950.00	475.00
1/16/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert brief	0.2	775.00	155.00
1/18/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and edit 2016.01.18 Salov -- DRAFT Motion for Class Certification	3.5	925.00	3237.50
1/18/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Misc class cert issues. Emails re class cert; call with A. Silver. Call with C. Weir.	1.5	775.00	1162.50
1/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Andrew Silver re sales of organic olive oil; edit draft Salov - Class Cert brief.	2.8	950.00	2660.00
1/19/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and revise 2016.01.19 Salov -- Motion for Class Certification (NEAR FINAL); Kumar Class Cert -- Simplicio Decl FINAL and Email with Kristen Simplicio.	3.6	925.00	3330.00
1/19/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Finalize and file class cert brief and Weir declaration, related emails	4.0	775.00	3100.00
1/20/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Motion to Certify Class.	3.0	950.00	2850.00
1/20/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss Colin's deposition with Kristen Simplicio.	0.2	925.00	185.00
1/20/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Matters relating to class cert; refile, coordinate courtesy copy	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/26/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re Weir depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/27/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Review and analyze subpoena to C. weir; communications with C. Weir re: deposition scheduling.	0.3	725.00	217.50
1/27/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re Weir depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Simplicio re Pictures of the bottles; email conversation with MattMcCrary re Kumar v. SNA: Notice of subpoena of Weir.	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/28/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Communications with C. Weir and opposing counsel re: scheduling C. Weir deposition.	0.6	725.00	435.00
1/28/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re Weir depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
2/1/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Conversation with Matt McCrary re Kumar v. SNA: Notice of subpoena of Weir.	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/2/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Communications with C. Weir and opposing counsel re: scheduling C. Weir deposition	0.2	725.00	145.00
2/2/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Email re Weir depo scheduling	0.1	775.00	77.50
2/3/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review law re voluntary change of practice; legal research	1.6	950.00	1520.00
2/4/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email Re: Salov - catalyst theory and the pre-suit demand requirement under 1021.5.	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/5/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Simplicio re wrapping up the Deoleo RFAs shortly. re Salov class cert opposition	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/5/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and revise Joint Stipulation to Continue Class Certification Briefing (2)	0.3	925.00	277.50
2/5/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Attention to case management issues; circulate to do list. Emails re Weir depo and class cert schedule, letter of request, other issues	0.3	775.00	232.50
2/8/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Andrew Silver re Kumar v. SNA: Notice of subpoena of Weir	0.0	950.00	0.00
2/8/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Matt McCrary, Kristen Simplicio re scheduling; review Kumar v. SNA Objections to Weir Subpoena (v1).	0.6	925.00	555.00
2/8/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Prepare objections to C. Weir document requests; telephone conference with C. Weir regarding documents.	1.3	725.00	942.50
2/8/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re stip and Weir depo scheduling	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/9/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re and revise Kumar v. SNA Objections to Weir Subpoena (v1) with Matt McCrary; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Set Motion and Deadlines/Hearing.	0.7	950.00	665.00
2/9/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Revise C. Weir objections in accordance with comments from A. Gutride; email objections to opposing counsel.	0.3	725.00	217.50
2/9/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re objections to Weir subpoena	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/10/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss internally, salov oppositionbrief	1.8	950.00	1710.00
2/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review ECF filing	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise with Kristen Simplicio: Salov -- Proposed Letter of Request (v5) (IFI).	0.0	950.00	0.00
2/12/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Email re letter of request	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Colin's preliminary regressions with Matt McCrary; Review Kumar v. SNA Response re Objections to Weir Subpoena; Discuss Olive Oil upcoming deadlines with Andrew Silver.	3.0	950.00	2850.00
2/16/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Review opposing counsel's response to objections to C. Weir subpoena, communications with A. Gutride re: same.	0.3	725.00	217.50
2/16/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Case management - call with A. Silver re letter of request and other projects; emails re Weir depo and documents; etc	0.4	775.00	310.00
2/18/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review invoice and discusse DTI Invoice: Rohini Kumar vs. Salov North America Corp. with Peter Milton.	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re Kumar v. SNA: Notice of subpoena of IRI	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/19/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Communications with C. Weir and opposing counsel re: C. Weir document production.	0.3	725.00	217.50
2/19/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert filing; letter of request; other case management items	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re Salov -- DRAFT Mot. to Issue Ltr. of Request; Salov -- Proposed Letter of Request (2.22); Salov -- DRAFT Mot. to Issue Ltr. of Request v2; Letter of Request -- Silver Decl.; edit same	0.9	950.00	855.00
2/22/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Prepare for C. Weir deposition preparation session and deposition; communications with C. Weir and opposing counsel re: start time for the deposition.	6.0	725.00	4350.00
2/22/16	Kristen Simplicio	Salov	Review proposed motion re letter of request; revise and edit. Related emails.	0.6	775.00	465.00
2/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prepare C Weir for deposition	3.5	950.00	3325.00
2/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v Salov: settlement	0.0	950.00	0.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
			Conduct deposition preparation session with C. Weir; travel to and from Boston for same.			
2/23/16	Matt McCrary	Salov		5.6	725.00	4060.00
2/23/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re letter of request motion	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/23/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re docs relating to C. Weir; scheduling, etc	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Defend C. Weir Deposition; travel to and from Boston for same.			
2/24/16	Matt McCrary	Salov		10.4	725.00	7540.00
2/24/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Calls/emails with TZ re filing of motion for letter of request and sealing process; coordinate courtesy copies	0.4	775.00	310.00
2/26/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email with expert re olive oil labels	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/1/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Correspondence with Matt McCrary re deposition video.	0.2	950.00	190.00
3/1/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Weir depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/3/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re dates	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/7/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re Weir depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
			Communications with court reporter re: Weir transcript.			
3/7/16	Matt McCrary	Salov		0.5	725.00	362.50
3/9/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Opposition/Response to Motion.		950.00	0.00
3/9/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review opposition to motion for letter of request	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review reply ISO motion for letter of request; related emails	0.5	775.00	387.50
3/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Salov - draft reply/motion for LOR with Kristen Semplicio, Andrew Silver.	1.0	950.00	950.00
3/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Opposition to class certification; annotate; review new case law	2.0	950.00	1900.00
			Review Salov -- DRAFT Reply ISO Mot. for LOR with Kristen Semplicio; email conversation with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v Salov: Deposition of Dr. Ugone; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Certificate of Service.			
3/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.9	950.00	855.00
3/16/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review class cert brief; reply ISO motion for letter of request. Misc case management emails	1.3	775.00	1007.50
3/17/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Salov - class cert reply with Kristen Semplicio;	1.0	950.00	950.00
3/17/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert reply, case management, letter of request	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v Salov: Deposition of Dr. Ugone; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Administrative Motion to File Under Seal.			
3/18/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.5	950.00	475.00
3/18/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re order on letter motion	0.1	775.00	77.50
			Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v Salov: Deposition of Dr. Ugone; Review Opposition to Motion for Class Certification; Ugone Declaration (Kumar v SNA) with Kristen Semplicio;			
3/21/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.2	950.00	190.00
3/21/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Salov - notes on class cert opposition.	1.2	925.00	1110.00
3/21/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review class cert opposition and declaration; circulate thoughts on strategy	1.0	775.00	775.00
			Phone conference with TZ re Salov/Safeway ; Email with Sean Commons re stipulate to continue our reply deadline.			
3/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.2	950.00	190.00
3/22/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov - Colin W. depo corrections.	0.2	925.00	185.00
3/22/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Ugone depo; Weir depo; Call with TZ	0.4	775.00	310.00
			Email with Sean Commons re and finalized Joint Stipulation to Continue Class Certification Briefing (Ugone).			
3/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.1	950.00	95.00
3/23/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Weir depo corrections, Ugone depo, other scheduling	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/23/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Review and analyze C. Weir's deposition transcript and prepare list of proposed corrections.	6.3	725.00	4567.50
3/24/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio, Adam Gutride re Re: Kumar v Salov: Deposition of Dr. Ugone.	0.2	925.00	185.00
3/24/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Ugone depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
			Finalized Salov: Weir Depo Corrections; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Motion for Discovery.			
3/25/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.8	950.00	760.00
3/26/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Sean Commons re Re: Kumar v Salov: Deposition of Dr. Ugone.	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/27/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re letter of request	0.1	775.00	77.50
			Review and email discssion with Sean Commons re Joint Stipulation to Continue Class Certification Briefing (Ugone); revise same			
3/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.3	950.00	285.00
3/29/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Stipulation	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/29/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Salov class cert strategy; call with A. Silver	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Email discussion with Jaya Gupta re Kumar v. SNA - Expert Materials; conversation with Matt McCrary re Fwd: Kumar v. SNA - Collin W. Deposition Errata.			
4/1/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.4	950.00	380.00
4/1/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Matt McCrary re Re: Kumar v. SNA - Colin W. Deposition Errata.	0.2	925.00	185.00
4/1/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re Weir depo	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/5/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re Ugone declaration and next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
			Discussion with Seth Safier reRe: Kumar - Proposed Omnibus Order for tomorrow's hearing ; Review 2016-04-07 Proposed Omnibus Order Granting Motion to Seal			
4/7/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.8	950.00	760.00
4/7/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss with A. Gutride hearing	0.4	925.00	370.00
4/10/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review RE: Salov - Ugone declaration/deposition with Andrew Silver	0.3	925.00	277.50
4/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review 2016.04.11 Salov -- DRAFT Proposed Letter of Request	0.4	950.00	380.00
			Coordinate next steps on class cert reply; review Ugone declaration, research law re objections, and emails re strategy. Call with A. Silver re next steps.			
4/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov		1.2	775.00	930.00
			Email with Ilona Squires re DTI Invoice/ Account # 109730/ Gutride Safier LLP; Email with Collin W. re Salov: Ugone deposition.			
4/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		0.3	950.00	285.00
4/12/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Fwd: DTI Invoice/ Account # 109730/ Gutride Safier LLP.	0.2	925.00	185.00
4/12/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re letter of request	0.1	775.00	77.50
			Review, revise, and finalized Ugone Deposition Outline; review documents; review Ugone history; discussion with Collin W. by email; Discuss and Review kumar_v_salovnorthamericacorp_caseno_414cv02411y.zip with Andrew Kearns, Kristen Semplicio.			
4/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		8.0	950.00	7600.00
			Preparations for absence. Organize files, emails re next steps and coverage issues (Ugone depo, letter of request, etc)			
4/13/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov		0.3	775.00	232.50
			Email with Nitin Reddy re Re: Kumar v Salov: Deposition of Dr. Ugone, court reporter confirmation; discuss Ugone with Safier			
4/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov		1.6	950.00	1520.00

Exhibit 1: GSLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
4/14/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss Ugone theory w/ Adam G; review recent Ugone cases	1.0	925.00	925.00
4/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Depo preparation	5.6	950.00	5320.00
4/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Ugone depo prep	4.0	950.00	3800.00
4/18/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Nitin Reddy, Collin W. re testimony on the statistical significance/ Deposition of Dr. Ugone; prepare for deposition; travel to Texas	12.0	950.00	11400.00
4/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Ugone Deposition and Discuss videography with Philip Beredo; return travel	14.0	950.00	13300.00
4/21/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft, finalized, and Email conversation with Hassan Zavareei and Andrew Silver: 2016.04.21 Salov -- DRAFT Proposed Letter of Request (revise per KS)	0.4	950.00	380.00
4/25/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review emails and documents received during absence. Related emails/calls	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/25/16	Matt McCrary	Salov	Review and Serve Weir Deposition Errata.	0.2	725.00	145.00
4/27/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio, Andrew Silver re evidentiary objections.	0.3	950.00	285.00
4/27/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v Salov -- revise Proposed Letter of Request; Kumar v Salov -- REDLINE Letter of Request	1.2	925.00	1110.00
4/27/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review emails re Ugone and class cert, emails re next steps. Call with A. Silver on same	0.4	775.00	310.00
4/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email discussion with Jaya gupta re Kumar v. SNA - Joint Stipulation to Continue Case Management; Review Kumar - Joint Stipulation to Continue Case Management Conference (5.9.2016)	0.4	950.00	380.00
4/28/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert strategy. Review email re stip and CMC	0.3	775.00	232.50
4/29/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email discussion with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar - Joint Stipulation to Continue Case Management Conference (5.9.2016)	0.3	950.00	285.00
4/29/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re typicality and adequacy section; look up facts	0.2	775.00	155.00
5/1/16	Seth Safier	Salov	research and draft: Kumar v Salov- adequacy typicality insert v1; review Kumar transcript; research case law	4.5	925.00	4162.50
5/2/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review: 04-19-16 Keith Ugone - TRANSCRIPT	3.5	950.00	3325.00
5/2/16	Seth Safier	Salov	research and draft: Kumar v Salov- adequacy typicality insert v1; review Kumar transcript; research case law	6.0	925.00	5550.00
5/2/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert next steps, CMC, and letter re Hague Convention.	0.4	775.00	310.00
5/3/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Stipulation.	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/3/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief; emails re foreign discovery strategy	6.5	775.00	5037.50
5/4/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief; misc emails	2.2	775.00	1705.00
5/5/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief	5.0	775.00	3875.00
5/6/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise 20160506 Weir Decl DRAFT from Collin W.; Edit Salov - class cert reply	7.0	950.00	6650.00
5/6/16	Seth Safier	Salov	class cert reply review and research	3.2	925.00	2960.00
5/6/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit class cert brief; emails with A. Gutride re Weir decl and next steps on filing.	4.0	775.00	3100.00
5/9/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft and Discuss with Andrew Silver: Salov -- DRAFT Reply ISO Class Cert v5; Review and Discuss with Collin W. & Kristen Semplicio 20160510 Weir Decl DRAFT	5.0	950.00	4750.00
5/9/16	Seth Safier	Salov	edit and final Kumar v Salov response to rule 11 070715 (final); Salov - July 7 Errata to Complaint (070715 final)	2.0	925.00	1850.00
5/9/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Work on class cert reply brief, evidentiary objections, supporting papers. Coordinate filing with TZ	10.0	775.00	7750.00
5/10/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and research Reply ISO Class Cert -- Motion to Seal -- Proposed Order; Review 20160510 Weir Declaration fom Collin W.; draft and Discuss Salov -- DRAFT Reply ISO Class Cert v8; Salov -- DRAFT Reply ISO Class Cert v8 with Kristen Semplicio	7.4	950.00	7030.00
5/10/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Finalize and file class cert reply brief and supporting papers	9.0	775.00	6975.00
5/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email discussion with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov - IRI materials file under seal.	0.4	950.00	380.00
5/11/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Natalie Olivo re Law360 Article On Class Cert. Bid In Olive Oil Labeling Suit.	0.2	925.00	185.00
5/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Misc issues relating to filing. Coordinate courtesy copies, other issues re filing under seal	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Salov -- 9th cir cases.	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Ansier, Brendan re notice administration in Salov.	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/17/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Objection; research same	0.4	950.00	380.00
5/17/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review filing re objections to Weir	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/18/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Internal discussions re motion for class certification delay hearing.	0.4	950.00	380.00
5/18/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Delay cert discussion with A. Gutride, et al	0.3	925.00	277.50
5/18/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Coordinate courtesy copies; other hearing prep	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review with Kristen Semplicio: Salov - Order re further submission on motion to seal;	0.3	950.00	285.00
5/19/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re Salov - court reporter	0.1	925.00	92.50
5/19/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review order re motion to seal and emails re next steps; calls re confirmation of courtesy copies	0.4	775.00	310.00
5/20/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conversation with Hassan Zavareei reKumar v. Salov North America; discuss tentative ruling with Seth Safier; prep	1.0	950.00	950.00
5/20/16	Seth Safier	Salov	review tentative; discuss with team	0.6	925.00	555.00
5/20/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Hearing prep/ discussion re moving hearing date; prepare notice of related case	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prepare for cert hearing	7.0	950.00	6650.00
5/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Declaration in Support	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/23/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v Salov - IRI Declaration; SIGNEDBeckerDecISOAdminMotSeal	0.2	925.00	185.00
5/23/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Hearing prep. Organize cases. Review all filings. Discussion with A Silver re motion to seal and related orders; same with D. Becker. Other emails.	1.0	775.00	775.00
5/24/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	In-person hearing on class cert and email conversation with Team re Salov: Report of Hearing on Class Cert	3.9	950.00	3705.00
5/24/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re videographer	0.1	925.00	92.50
5/24/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Class cert hearing (travel - 1)	2.5	775.00	1937.50
5/25/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei: 2016.01.19 HAZ Declaration ISO Class Cert (Salov)	0.5	950.00	475.00
5/25/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re next steps after hearing. REview declarations re jury trial experience. Prepare information regarding personal trial experience for firm resume.	0.3	775.00	232.50
5/25/16	Matt McCrary	Salov		0.5	725.00	362.50
5/26/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei: 2016.01.19 HAZ Supp Declaration ISO Class Cert (Salov)	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/26/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re follow up from class cert hearing	0.1	775.00	77.50

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
5/27/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email discussion of Kumar v. SNA - Clean Copies of Class Certification Papers with Jaya Gupta; Review Activity in Case 4:14-cv-02411-YGR Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Proposed Order.	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/27/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re follow up from class cert hearing	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/30/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email discussion with Marie McCrary re Judge's query re how many times we had tried cases to verdict before a jury; poll firm	0.5	950.00	475.00
5/31/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss with Hassan Zavareei Re: 2016.01.19 HAZ Supp Declaration ISO Class Cert (Salov)	0.3	925.00	277.50
5/31/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re follow up from class cert hearing. Finalize and file declarations and final decision from Safeway	0.3	775.00	232.50
6/1/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Declaration in Support; email discussion with Hassan Zavareei re proposed edits to your declaration	0.2	950.00	190.00
6/1/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Finalize and file declarations and related case statement	0.3	775.00	232.50
6/2/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Notice of Appearance	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/7/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review 6-7-16 Letter from S. Commons; research same	0.3	925.00	277.50
6/7/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Letter re olive oil purchases	0.1	775.00	77.50
6/9/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review 6-7-16 Letter from S. Commons and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio.	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/9/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss video from Salov depo of Ugone with Adam Gutride	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/10/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Re: Kumar v. SNA - letter re olive oil purchases with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
6/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft and edit response to Salov letter;	0.8	950.00	760.00
6/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss issue with the Safeway club card records with Kristen Semplicio	0.4	950.00	380.00
6/16/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Draft response to Salov letter re olive oil purchases	0.4	775.00	310.00
6/17/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and discuss w Jaya Gupta: Kumar v. SNA - Dr. Keith Ugone Deposition Confidentiality	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/17/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio re Safeway/Finalize and file class cert reply/ CMC statement	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/17/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re olive oil purchase letter	0.2	775.00	155.00
6/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Kristen Semplicio re Re: Kumar v. SNA - letter re olive oil purchases	0.4	950.00	380.00
6/22/16	Seth Safier	Salov	review and research- letter re olive oil purchases	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/22/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re olive oil letter; call with Adam re olive oil purchases	0.4	775.00	310.00
6/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise, Review, and Discuss with Kristen SimolicoKumar v. Salov response to letter re recent olive oil purchases (v1); Email with Jeffrey Kalie re Re: proposed class notices.	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/24/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Finalized Kumar v. Salov response to letter re recent olive oil purchases (final); PL000572-79; PL000570-571 with Kristen Semplicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/24/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Finalize and serve olive oil purchase letter; produce documents. Related discussions re strategy	0.6	775.00	465.00
7/5/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Administrative Motion to File Under Seal; Discuss Kumar v. SNA - letter re olive oil purchases with Kristen Semplicio.	0.5	950.00	475.00
7/5/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email from S. Commons re pl purchase history; prepare docs for production, other emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/6/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review AMENDED ORDER GRANTING PENDING MOTIONS TO SEAL re [121] Order on Administrative Motion to File Under Seal	0.2	950.00	190.00
7/6/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Motion to File Under Seal	0.2	775.00	155.00
7/7/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review court orders on motion to seal, related emails	0.2	950.00	190.00
7/7/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar - merits discovery	0.2	950.00	190.00
7/8/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Andrew Silver, Kristen Semplicio re Kumar - merits discovery; Review ECF notice	0.6	950.00	570.00
7/8/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review purchase records; related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Salov/Ugone; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Motion for Miscellaneous Relief	0.3	950.00	285.00
7/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review notice re motion to seal. Call with A. Silver re strategy for sealing. Related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Activity in Case 4:14-cv-02411-YGR Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Motion to Certify Class	0.2	950.00	190.00
7/12/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Calls/emails with A. Silver re motion to seal and order	0.2	775.00	155.00
7/15/16	Seth Safier	Salov	review cert order; discussion re same, conf call	1.5	925.00	1387.50
7/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss Re: Activity in Case 4:14-cv-02411-YGR Kumar v. Salov North America with Kristen Semplicio; Review order granting certification and Discuss with Colin W.; discuss with team	2.5	950.00	2375.00
7/15/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review order on class cert; related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
7/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. SNA - Joint Case Management Statement from Matt Light		950.00	0.00
7/18/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss RE: Salov certification order with Andrew Silver; Review and Discuss Joint Stipulation to Continue 7_25_16 CMC from Matt Light		950.00	0.00
7/18/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and Discuss Re: Salov certification order with Adam Gutride.		925.00	0.00
7/18/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class cert; CMC strategy. Stip and attn to dates	0.2	775.00	155.00
7/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Set/Reset Hearing.	0.1	950.00	95.00
8/2/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with A. Gutride; emails with TZ re next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/4/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Andrew Silver, Kristen Semplicio re CMC statement;	1.0	950.00	950.00
8/4/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re conference call	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/5/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Brendan Ansier re RE: Rohini Kumar v. Salov North America Corp mass tort solutions;	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/8/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Sean Commons re Call re Salov CMC statement; prepare for call	0.4	950.00	380.00
8/8/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with TZ re next steps in case	0.8	775.00	620.00
8/9/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft Report and email conversation with Seth Safier and Team re Sean Commons call re settling - a nationwide class, for the IFI claim, with a claims-made structure; call w SAS re same	1.7	950.00	1615.00
8/9/16	Seth Safier	Salov	discuss settlement with Adam G.	0.5	925.00	462.50
8/9/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with A Gutride re settlement	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/10/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Andrew Silver re Salov CMC draft; Review proposed settlement (Kumar v. Salov, Inc) Aug 10 2006 v2 and Discuss with Seth Safier, Kristen Semplicio. Et al.	1.5	950.00	1425.00
8/10/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review CMC statement; related emails re next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft, finalized, Discuss proposed settlement (Kumar v Salov Inc) Aug 10 2006 v2 (tz) with Hassan Zavareei, Kristen Semplicio, Sean Commons.	1.8	950.00	1710.00
8/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement; review settlement proposal	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Hassan Zavareei re Safeway CMC continuance, and Re: proposed settlement (Kumar v Salov Inc) Aug 10 2006 v2 (tz).	0.3	950.00	285.00
8/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Seth Safier re Re: proposed settlement (Kumar v Salov Inc) Aug 10 2006 v2 (tz).	0.3	950.00	285.00
8/14/16	Seth Safier	Salov	discuss settlement agreement; edit and review same	0.3	925.00	277.50
8/15/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Salov CMC statement on hold pending settlement	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Phone conference with Sean Commons re using a free mediator.	0.4	950.00	380.00

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
8/16/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride about mediation.	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/17/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v. SNA - Updated Joint Case Management Statement.	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/17/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re CMC scheduling and statement; related call	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Matt Light at Sidley and phone conference with Sean Commons re Kumar - revise Updated Joint Case Management Statement (8_19_16); Email with Andrew Silver re revision to jointly propose a period for mediation	1.2	950.00	1140.00
8/19/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review CMC statement from opposing counsel, emails/discussion re next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
8/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise SNA - Kumar_Stipulation to Continue 8.29.2016 CMC (v2); SNA - Kumar_Stipulation to Continue 8.29.2016 CMC (v2) and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio; Meet and confer with Safeway	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/22/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Revise and edit stip, review, other emails re CMC and scheduling	0.3	775.00	232.50
8/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email re re CP Redline - SNA - Kumar_Stipulation to Continue 8.29.2016 with Sean Commons.	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/24/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Stipulation.	0.1	950.00	95.00
8/24/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to dates, review court order	0.1	775.00	77.50
8/25/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Salov CMC; Email with Sean Commons re timing and mediation; discuss same with S Safier	0.4	950.00	380.00
8/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Hassan Zavareei re SD Cal denies approval to injunctive only settlement; review case	0.3	950.00	285.00
8/29/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Transcription service re payment	0.1	950.00	95.00
8/29/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Transcription payment.	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/31/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Hassan Zavareei, Sean Commons re Kumar v Salov - mediation communication.	0.7	950.00	665.00
9/1/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement proposals; call with A Gutride	0.3	775.00	232.50
9/2/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v Salov - confidential settlement/mediation communication from Sean Commons.	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/6/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei, Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v Salov Order on 8.29.16 stip to continue; Kumar v Salov Order on 8.29.16 stip to continue.	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/9/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Phone conference with Hassan Zavareei re counterproposal and a redline.	0.4	925.00	370.00
9/9/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v SNA - Signed Supplemental Interrogatory Responses (10-5-2015); email discussion of and Review Re: Salov Sales figures: units with Collin W..	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/12/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Research sales volume, related emails on settlement	0.3	775.00	232.50
9/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v Salov - mediation communication; discuss mediators with SAS	0.7	950.00	665.00
9/13/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Re: Kumar v Salov: Settlement Proposals & Mediators; call re same	0.5	925.00	462.50
9/13/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re mediators.	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re Re: salov mediation	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/15/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Inquiries to mediators; discuss with Adam G.	2.0	925.00	1850.00
9/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Nint Reddy re draft the stipulation to extend the deadline and continue the CMC.	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/16/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Michael Richards re mediation.	0.2	925.00	185.00
9/16/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/20/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Nitin Reddy re mediators	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/20/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Michael Richards re mediation.	0.2	925.00	185.00
9/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Hassan Zavareei, Nitin Reddy re SNA - Kumar_Stipulation to Continue 10.17.2016 CMC; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Motion to Withdraw as Attorney.	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/23/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review FW: Kumar v. Salov (Mediation - Nov. 8) from Hassan Zavareei.	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/23/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review ECF filing	0.1	775.00	77.50
9/27/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Nitin Reddy re mediators.	0.1	950.00	95.00
9/29/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Sean Commons re mediators re SNA - Kumar_Stipulation to Continue 10.17.2016 CMC; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order.	0.2	950.00	190.00
9/29/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review stip, attention to dates	0.2	775.00	155.00
9/30/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	review case and docket	0.1	775.00	77.50
10/3/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Stipulation; Discuss mediation schedule with Kristen Semplicio	0.4	950.00	380.00
10/3/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Attention to dates	0.1	775.00	77.50
10/4/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails/discussions re mediation brief and strategy	0.3	775.00	232.50
10/11/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re mediation strategy and next steps in case. Review Safeway mediation brief and determine strategy	0.4	775.00	310.00
10/26/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with co-counsel; emails re mediation strategy and brief writing	0.5	775.00	387.50
10/27/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Anna Haac re 3% California sales figure	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/27/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Kristen Semplicio re nationwide damages vs CA's damages	0.1	925.00	92.50
10/27/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re mediation brief	0.2	775.00	155.00
10/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Anna Haac, Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v. Salov Mediation	0.6	950.00	570.00
10/28/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re mediation brief	0.1	775.00	77.50
10/31/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Anna Haac, Kristen Semplicio re 2016 10 31 Ltr to Mediator (DRAFT).	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/31/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re mediation brief	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/1/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise 2016 10 31 Ltr to Mediator (DRAFT) v2 ajg and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio.	2.8	950.00	2660.00
11/1/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Review mediation statement; related emails re statement and strategy	1.2	775.00	930.00
11/2/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise 2016 10 31 Ltr to Mediator (DRAFT) v3 ajg and Discuss with Anna Haac.	1.4	950.00	1330.00
11/2/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss mediator's fees with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	925.00	185.00
11/2/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re mediation	0.2	775.00	155.00
11/3/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Exhibit Joint Submission and Discuss with Anna Haac.	0.5	950.00	475.00
11/7/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Discuss 2016 11 02 Kumar v. Salov Plaintiff's Mediation Ltr; Kumar v. Salov Joint Submission of Exhibits with Michael Richards, Kristen Semplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
11/7/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Discuss and schedule mediation meeting with Adam Gutride.	0.3	925.00	277.50
11/7/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails/call re mediation	0.2	775.00	155.00
11/8/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Mediation; travel; pre meeting	11.0	950.00	10450.00
11/8/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Mediation	10.3	925.00	9527.50
11/8/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re mediation	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/9/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with A Gutride re mediation	0.1	775.00	77.50

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
11/11/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v. Salov (Mediation - Nov. 8)	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft form of settlement agreement and exhibits	6.0	950.00	5700.00
11/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Draft settlement agreement and exhibits	7.5	950.00	7125.00
11/14/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re CMC statement/status report and next steps	0.3	775.00	232.50
11/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re Kumar - Status Report, Joint Stip and Proposed Order	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Stipulation; Email with Sean Commons RE: exemplar of agreement	0.4	950.00	380.00
11/16/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Review court order; attn to dates	0.2	775.00	155.00
11/17/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons RE: exemplar of agreement	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/18/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email and phone conference with Sean Commons re terms of agreement.	0.5	950.00	475.00
11/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re terms of agreement.	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and revise settlement agreement, exhibits; Email with Sean Commons re RE: exemplar of agreement (mediation / settlement discussions)	3.0	950.00	2850.00
11/22/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review Kristen Smplicio time entry re SalovEmails/discussions re mediation brief and strategy	0.2	925.00	185.00
11/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prepare for and conduct conference with Sean Commons re RE: Salov settlement	0.7	950.00	665.00
11/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re Salov settlement	0.2	950.00	190.00
11/28/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email Kristen Smplicio re Salov - CMC statement	0.2	925.00	185.00
11/28/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re CMC statement	0.1	775.00	77.50
11/29/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Re: Kumar v. Salov -- Letter to Court regarding CMC & Settlement; email Seth Safier, Hassan Zavareei, Kristen Smplicio re settlement; Email with Sean Commons re Kumar v Salov - Ltr YGR re settlement 11 29 16	0.8	950.00	760.00
11/29/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re prelim approval hearing		925.00	0.00
11/29/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Discussions re settlement and next steps. Prepare letter and related emails	0.6	775.00	465.00
11/30/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: Fwd: Kumar v. Salov -- Letter to Court regarding CMC & Settlement; Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Transcript		950.00	0.00
11/30/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re ECF filing	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/5/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons, Anna Haac, Hassan Zavareei re Kumar v. Salov -- Settlement		950.00	0.00
12/5/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re preliminary approval	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/6/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v. Salov -- Settlement; review agreements draft & finalized Settlement Term Sheet Memorandum of Understanding CLAIMS MADE dec 7; Email with Sean Commons to discuss Settlement Term Sheet Memorandum of Understanding CLAIMS MADE dec 7	1.5	950.00	1425.00
12/7/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Adam Gutride: Settlement Term Sheet Memorandum of Understanding CLAIMS MADE dec 7	5.0	950.00	4750.00
12/7/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email re draft settlement agreement	3.0	925.00	2775.00
12/7/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Prepare for and conduct conference with Jeff Margulies re Kumar; discuss settlement agreement with Seth Safier	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/8/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and edit settlement agreement; Discuss settlement agreement with Adam Gutride, Kristen Smplicio.	0.6	950.00	570.00
12/8/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review, Discuss with Seth safier, Sean Commons, Hassan Zavareei: Settlement Term Sheet Memorandum of Understanding CLAIMS MADE; MOU - Sidley signature	4.0	925.00	3700.00
12/8/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re preliminary approval and other next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
12/9/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, Discuss with Adam Gutride: Settlement Term Sheet Memorandum of Understanding CLAIMS MADE; MOU - Sidley signature	0.4	950.00	380.00
12/9/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review, Discuss with Adam Gutride: Settlement Term Sheet Memorandum of Understanding CLAIMS MADE; MOU - Sidley signature	0.3	925.00	277.50
12/9/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Email re next steps on settlement	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/10/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Prepare for and conduct and Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v. Salov -- Settlement		950.00	0.00
12/12/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Kristen Smplicio, Andrew Silver re Re: Kumar - merits discovery; draft and Email with Sean Commons re Kumar v Salov settlement agreement 12.12.16 v2	4.0	950.00	3800.00
12/12/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Email re settlement agreement	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/13/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Heffler Claims: Exhibit A Claim Form amended 12.6.16 final; Exhibit B1 Long Form Notice amended 12.6.16 final; Exhibit B2 email notice amended 12.6.16 final; Exhibit B3 online notice amended 12.6.16 final; Machlan v P&G Second Amended Complaint 12.6.16 final; Gutride Decl ISO Motion For Preliminary Approval (Machlan v. PG) (final); Declaration of Mark Rapazini final with exhibits	3.0	950.00	2850.00
12/14/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Smplicio: Kumar v Salov settlement agreement 12.12.16 v3 kgs edits	0.4	950.00	380.00
12/14/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Revise and edit settlement papers	0.7	775.00	542.50
12/15/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss Kumar v Salov settlement agreement 12-14-2016 redline with Sean Commons	2.0	950.00	1900.00
12/15/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Hassan Zavareei re Exhibit E Undertaking 12 14 16 v2	0.2	925.00	185.00
12/15/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and next steps	0.2	775.00	155.00
12/16/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email withNitin Reddy re Kumar v Salov: Settlement Documents	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/16/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/17/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: Kumar v. Salov -- Settlement	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/19/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Collin W. re Salov Units for Settlement--CONFIDENTIAL spreadsheet	0.5	950.00	475.00
12/21/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft and email discussion with Jeanne Finegan re OLIVE OIL Draft Declaration	0.4	950.00	380.00
12/21/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Review and email disccusion with Anna Haac re Salov Motion for Preliminary Approval Class Action Settlement; edit same (DRAFT)	2.4	925.00	2220.00
12/22/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Sean Commons re Kumar v Salov settlement agreement 12-21-2016 redline; Kumar v Salov settlement - long form notice 12-21-2016 redline; Exhibit A Claim Form (12.21.2016)	2.5	950.00	2375.00
12/22/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Re: salov valuation of injunctive relief	0.3	925.00	277.50
12/22/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/23/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Anna Haac re Re: Salov: Draft Motion for Preliminary Approval; Review and Discuss with Nitin Reddy: Kumar v Salov settlement agreement 12-23-2016; Exhibit C proposed prelim approval order 12 23 16; Exhibit A Claim Form (12.23.2016); Exhibit B1 long form notice 12 23 16	2.1	950.00	1995.00
12/23/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/26/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and email re Kumar v Salov: Settlement Documents	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/26/16	Kristen Smplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50

Exhibit 1: GSLLP Salov Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
12/27/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Email with Anna Haac re Compare; Joint Decl ISO Motion For Preliminary Approval (Salov) (DRAFT); email and phone conf with Veronica Bradley re RE: NAOOA v. D'Avolio Inc et al. (EDNY) -- Introduction	1.4	950.00	1330.00
12/27/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re preliminary approval and settlement	0.2	775.00	155.00
12/28/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	draft and revise Gutride Decl ISO Motion For Preliminary Approval (Salov) (DRAFT)	2.0	950.00	1900.00
12/28/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and prelim approval	0.1	775.00	77.50
12/29/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: OLIVE OIL Draft Declaration; finalized and Email with Sean Commons, Nitin Reddy re Kumar v Salov settlement agreement 12-29-2016 final with exhibits	2.5	950.00	2375.00
12/29/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re settlement and prelim approval. Coordinate signatures and filings	0.5	775.00	387.50
12/30/16	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re RE: OLIVE OIL Draft Declaration; review draft decl	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/30/16	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Salov costs	0.4	925.00	370.00
12/30/16	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prepare motion for preliminary approval for filing. Coordinate signatures. Revise and edit and finalize and file	1.5	775.00	1162.50
1/3/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	finalize settlement agreements; Email with Nitin Reddy re RE: Kumar v Salov: Final Settlement Docs	3.6	950.00	3420.00
1/5/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Nitin Reddy Kumar - Redline of Complaint	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/5/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Email re notice	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/6/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Set Motion and Deadlines/Hearings	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/6/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re hearing date, amended complaint	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/9/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Motion for Pro Hac Vice	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/9/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re CMC and hearing	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/11/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Anna Haac: RE: Hearing on Preliminary Approval Motion	1.5	950.00	1425.00
1/11/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re hearing prep	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/13/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review, revise, Discuss with Anna Haac: 2017.01.13 Salov Amended Motion for Preliminary Approval; 2017.01.13 [Amended Proposed] Preliminary Approval Order; Review, Discuss with Nitin Reddy: Kumar v Salov - Draft Stip re amended complaint	3.0	950.00	2850.00
1/13/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re stip and amended complaint	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/14/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Nitin Reddy re RE: Kumar v Salov: Redline of complaint [confidential settlement	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/16/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Nitin Reddy re Kumar - First Amended Complaint v1	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/16/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Draft stip; emails re case management matters	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/17/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Finalize Kumar v Salov - Stip re amended complaint (final); Review Kumar v Salov - Stip re CMC (v1)	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/17/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Finalize and file stip; emails re hearing and CMC	0.2	775.00	155.00
1/18/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Proposed Order	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/18/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Prepare letter to court re CMC; related emails. Finalize and file	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/19/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Olive Oil Buyers Take 50 Cents A Bottle To End False Ad Suit	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/19/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Organize filings and cases for hearing; related emails	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/23/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Nitin Reddy re Re: Kumar v Salov: Redline of complaint; prepare for preliminary approval hearing	7.5	950.00	7125.00
1/23/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re materials for hearing	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/24/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	In-person meetin with Anna Haac to discuss hearing; in-person hearing on preliminary approval	4.0	950.00	3800.00
1/24/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re hearing	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/25/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Motion Hearing minutes	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/25/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Call with A Gutride re hearing	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/26/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	revise and Discuss with Anna Haac, Sean Commons: 2017.01.26 Second Amended Proposed Preliminary Approval Order	0.5	950.00	475.00
1/26/17	Seth Safier	Salov	review and revise order - preliminary approval	0.3	925.00	277.50
1/27/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Order on Stipulation	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/30/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review ECF Kumar v. Salov North America Corp et al Set/Reset Hearings	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/2/17	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Adam Gutride re Salov settlement	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/6/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons RE: Kumar v Salov - timeline	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/6/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class notice	0.1	775.00	77.50
2/8/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with TZ (co counsel) re DRAFT Weir Declaration; review and edit same	0.6	950.00	570.00
2/10/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re Kumar v Salov: Final Approval/Value of Changed Practices	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/13/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Collin W. re Re: Salov unit #s	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/15/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review and email conversation with Heffler Claims re Kumar v Salov North America (Olive Oil Website) & Drafts of Claim	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/16/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email conversation with Sean Commons re Re: salov final approval	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/16/17	Seth Safier	Salov	Review research re Re: HR 985 re Salov fee award	0.4	925.00	370.00
2/17/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with Heffler Claims re RE: Kumar v SNA (Olive Oil Settlement)	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/21/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Review email correspondence between Heffler Claims & Sean Commons RE: Kumar v SNA (Olive Oil Settlement)	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/27/17	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Sean Commons re broken Submit button on website for plaintiffs	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/27/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class notice	0.1	775.00	77.50
2/28/17	Adam Gutride	Salov	Email with HefflerClaims re press releases; review Heffler press releases	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/28/17	Seth Safier	Salov	Email with Scott Miller re preliminary approval on Rohini Kumar v. Salov North America Corp	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/28/17	Kristen Semplicio	Salov	Emails re class notice	0.1	775.00	77.50
TOTAL	Adam Gutride	Salov		407.7	950.00	387315.00
TOTAL	Seth Safier	Salov		212.8	925.00	196840.00
TOTAL	Todd Kennedy	Salov		0.4	850.00	340.00
TOTAL	Kristen Semplicio	Salov		306.0	775.00	237150.00
TOTAL	Marie McCrary	Salov		20.8	750.00	15600.00
TOTAL	Matt McCrary	Salov		32.8	725.00	23780.00
			TOTAL	980.5		861025.00

EXHIBIT 2

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
11/13/13	Seth Safier	OliveOil	research into olive oil marketing of extra virgin olive oil; imported from Italy; research into previous litigation; call with Adam Gutride re research	2.2	925.00	2035.00
11/13/13	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	call with Seth Safier re olive oil litigation	0.5	950.00	475.00
11/14/13	Kristen Smplicio	OliveOil	Emails and research re olive oil, Treasury dept regs, and review of memo	4.0	775.00	3100.00
11/15/13	Kristen Smplicio	OliveOil	Research on preemption, primary jurisdiction, and treasury dept regs; review briefs from DC litigation, and related emails on strategy	5.5	775.00	4262.50
11/18/13	Kristen Smplicio	OliveOil	Prepare email summarizing research on primary jurisdiction, preemption, other issues; related emails and research	2.5	775.00	1937.50
11/18/13	Seth Safier	OliveOil	prepare for and attend con call with co-counsel; discuss same with A. Gutride; review emails from K. Smplicio on case law	0.8	925.00	740.00
11/18/13	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	discuss litigation strategy and merits with S. Safier; attend conference call with T&Z; review correspondence	0.9	950.00	855.00
11/22/13	Kristen Smplicio	OliveOil	Conference call with Tycko & Zavareei	0.6	775.00	465.00
12/30/13	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conducted research on Spain regulations; research Italian regulations, discuss same with E. Moretti	1.4	925.00	1295.00
12/30/13	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review article on Spain regulations	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/6/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email Hassan Zavareii to set up meeting; discuss testing with Seth Safier	0.6	950.00	570.00
1/6/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Corresponded with Adam Gutride re purchase of bottles; call with Adam Gutride regarding testing protocol, shipping and handling olive oil and representative purchases	0.8	925.00	740.00
1/8/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review and discuss potential plaintiff correspondence with Seth Safier.	0.4	950.00	380.00
1/8/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss purchase history with potential plaintiff; research same; email summary of plaintiff correspondence to Adam Gutride; call with Adam re same	2.2	925.00	2035.00
1/11/14	Kristen Smplicio	OliveOil	Discuss Plaintiff with A. Gutride	0.3	775.00	232.50
1/11/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss plaintiff with Kristen Smplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/14/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion of plaintiffs with Seth Safier & Hassan Zavareii	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/14/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Corresponded with Adam Gutride re plaintiffs; call to discuss potential plaintiffs with A. Gutride	0.5	925.00	462.50
1/22/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion of plaintiffs; discuss geographical origins regulations and case law, administrative opinions with Kristen Smplicio.	0.6	950.00	570.00
1/22/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email discussion of plaintiffs re geographical origins with Adam Gutride.	0.3	925.00	277.50
1/27/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion of plaintiffs & purchases at Safeway & Target brands with Kristin Smplicio.	0.4	950.00	380.00
1/28/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review plaintiff facts and discuss with Seth Safier; conduct online research re potential plaintiffs background	1.1	950.00	1045.00
1/28/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss plaintiffs with Adam Gutride; research potential plaintiffs online	0.6	925.00	555.00
1/29/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review research on olive oil regulations via New York Times from Todd Kennedy, Email conversation re country of origin with Seth Safier.	0.4	950.00	380.00
1/29/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conducted research on Bertolli & Unilever; email conversation with Kristen Smplicio about brands and stores.	0.7	925.00	647.50
1/29/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	research in place of business for Bertolli, et al	0.5	925.00	462.50
1/30/14	Kristen Smplicio	OliveOil	draft email re olive oil to Seth, Adam et al	0.1	775.00	77.50
1/30/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review email from Kristen re olive oil regs and case strategy	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/3/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email Seth Safier re suing Med Foods.	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/3/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email conversation with Adam Gutride re Med Foods.	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/4/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation re fees & expenses with Hassan Zavareei; Email Jay Kuo re plaintiffs.	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/4/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email conversation re jurisdiction with Hassan Zavareei; discuss same by telePrep for and attend with Adam G	0.8	925.00	740.00
2/5/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Corresponded with Hassan re Testing info and proposed agreement; telephone discussion regarding agreement with TZ with Safier	1.0	950.00	950.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
2/5/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email conversation with Hassan Zavareei re Dean Fueroghne.	0.3	925.00	277.50
2/6/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Corresponded with Hassan Zavareei & Review EVOO Litigation Draft Co-Counsel Agreement	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/6/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Hassan Zavareei & Review EVOO Litigation Draft Co-Counsel Agreement	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/11/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss buying bottles of various labels with Seth	0.6	950.00	570.00
2/11/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and edited EVOO Litigation Draft Co-Counsel Agreement; Discuss buying bottles of various labels with Adam.	1.4	925.00	1295.00
2/12/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review olive oil survey with Todd Kennedy	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/12/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss testing oils with Adam Gutride and Hassan Zavareei.	0.8	925.00	740.00
2/12/14	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Discuss olive oil survey with A. Gutride	0.2	850.00	170.00
2/13/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conversation about survey and response rate with Todd Kennedy.	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/13/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conversation about testing oils with Hassan Zavareei.	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/14/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss surveying California residents with Todd Kennedy.	0.2	950.00	190.00
2/14/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conversation with Adam Gutride and Todd Kennedy about survey geography.	0.6	925.00	555.00
2/15/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conversation with Todd Kennedy re survey protocol and geography; email and discuss same with S. Safier	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/17/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Read and Discuss EVOO Litigation Draft Co-Counsel Agreement v3 with Hassan Zavareei; revise same; discuss revisions with S. Safier	1.3	950.00	1235.00
2/17/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss procedure for selection of purchase of bottles with Adam Gutride; review revisions to co-counsel agreement; discuss revisions to cocounsel agreement w/ Adam	1.0	925.00	925.00
2/18/14	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Call with Adam Gutride re survey mechanics	0.7	850.00	595.00
2/18/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss potential plaintiffs with Kristen Semplicio; met by phone with Todd Kennedy re survey particulars.	0.9	950.00	855.00
2/18/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review article re US olive oil pushing gov't to test imported oils and Discuss same with Hassan Zavareei.	0.6	925.00	555.00
2/20/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Email re possible olive oil plaintiff, research re filing of lawsuits and impact on citizenship application	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/24/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review 2014.02.24 EVOO Co-Counsel Agreement (Signed by H. Zavareei); Review and Discuss internal research with Seth Safier; read Nytimes article	1.4	950.00	1330.00
2/24/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Research olive oil statistics by brand and label; discuss with Adam Gutride; discuss drafting a complaint with Hassan; draft complaint; Review olive oil research with Kristen Semplicio.	5.8	925.00	5365.00
2/24/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Review NYT article, related emails re new plaintiff and complaints	0.2	775.00	155.00
2/25/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Call with Scott Koller re EVOO purchases; travel for and make EVOO purchases at several stores; Prep for and attend call with S Koller	6.8	925.00	6290.00
2/25/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Prep for and attend call with Koller (Plaintiff)	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/26/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss right of action under the Lanham Act with Seth Safier; discuss Kangadis case	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/26/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and Discuss with A Gutride Lanham Act claim; review Kangadis Food - NJ Complaint; Kangadis Food - NJ Docket; Kangadis Food - Summary Judgment Order; Kangadis Food - Class Certification Order; Kangadis Food - Motion to Dismiss Order.	2.0	925.00	1850.00
2/27/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss plaintiff with Kristen Semplicio; scheduled meeting with plaintiff; Discuss http://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pubmed/16787029 J Agric Food Chem. 2006 Jun 28;54(13):4790-4 with Seth Safier; Discuss EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet with Adam Gutride.	1.0	950.00	950.00
2/27/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Research & Review http://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pubmed/16787029 J Agric Food Chem. 2006 Jun 28;54(13):4790-4 with Adam Gutride.	0.6	925.00	555.00
2/27/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Review article re radiation, emails re plaintiff	0.1	775.00	77.50

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
2/28/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review & Discuss EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet with Seth Safier.	1.5	950.00	1425.00
2/28/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet with Adam Gutride.	1.0	925.00	925.00
3/3/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review correspondence re testing schedule	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/4/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conversation re Kristen Semplicio re purchasing & plaintiff; review and revise draft complaint and Discuss national class with Seth Safier.	4.0	950.00	3800.00
3/4/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss nationalclass allegations & negligent misrepresentation with Adam Gutride; conversation about plaintiff and purchasing with Kristen Semplicio.	1.2	925.00	1110.00
3/4/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review draft complaint; research "best if used by" USDA standards, research tariff act regulations, t/c with S Safier re same	1.5	950.00	1425.00
3/4/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re plaintiff and case strategy	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/5/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re new plaintiff, CA state law, legislative history, etc	0.3	775.00	232.50
3/6/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re case strategy	0.1	775.00	77.50
3/7/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review & Discuss cocounsel agreement letter with Seth Safier & Kristen Semplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
3/7/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review & Discuss cocounsel agreement letter with Adam Gutride & Kristen Semplicio.	0.3	925.00	277.50
3/7/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Draft engagement letter, related emails	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/7/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Discuss cocounsel agreement and work split with Adam	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/8/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conversation with Kristen Semplicio re cocounsel agreement.	0.3	950.00	285.00
3/8/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conversation via email re oil testing with Jeff Kaliel; research same; conduct research into testing facility; research shipping	2.4	925.00	2220.00
3/9/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conversation via email re 2014.02.24 EVOO Co-Counsel Agreement with Kristen Semplicio.	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/10/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	forward co-counsel agreement for use in Safeway case	0.2	950.00	190.00
3/11/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Email re class cert opinion against Safeway, review order	0.2	775.00	155.00
3/21/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion re Giant with Seth Safier & Hassan Zavareei.	0.5	950.00	475.00
3/21/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email discussion re country of origin claims with Hassan Zavareei & Adam Gutride.	0.5	925.00	462.50
3/27/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email discussion of scheduling chemical tests with Jeffrey Kaliel & Hassan Zavareei.	0.4	925.00	370.00
3/31/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re new plaintiff	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/1/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss creating new case; Review lab report from Australia; research test results/	3.0	950.00	2850.00
4/1/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email re creating new case for Filippo Berio; Discuss Australian lab testing of olive oils with Jeff Kaliel; Report R14-00382 from Jeff Kaliel.	1.0	925.00	925.00
4/1/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Review test results	0.3	775.00	232.50
4/14/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss wording of claim with Adam Gutride; revise wording of claim with Kristen Semplicio.	0.8	925.00	740.00
4/14/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	revise specifics of wording claim re bottle, labeling with Seth Safier & Kristen Semplicio; review and revise class action Complaint Koller v Med Foods Inc (v11).	2.8	950.00	2660.00
4/15/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and revise wording of claim with Seth Safier.	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/15/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss testing process and wording re deceptive labeling, non-protective bottles, and "best if used by" dates with Adam Gutride and Marie McCrary.	0.5	925.00	462.50
4/16/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email exchange re wording of claim and specifics of testing re date of purchase with Marie McCrary and Seth Safier.	0.3	950.00	285.00
4/16/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email exchange re including Unilever in case with Jeff Kaliel; Received & processed invoice for Testing; Review and revise wording of claims with Adam Gutride.	1.7	925.00	1572.50
4/21/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss timing of filing Federal and California complaint with Hassan Zavareei (TZLegal); Review Testing dates with Australia lab with Marie McCrary.	0.9	925.00	832.50
4/22/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review draft of Complaint and Discuss with Hassan Z; Discuss, Review and edited complaint; research same	2.5	925.00	2312.50
4/23/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email Rod Mailer re meeting in Australia.	0.2	950.00	190.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
4/23/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email Marie re timing of filing complaint; Review testing summary from Australian lab with Marie McCrary; revise draft of Complaint and Discuss with Marie McCrary.	3.6	925.00	3330.00
4/24/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re complaint and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/25/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	schedule meeting with Rod Mailer re lab testing.	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/25/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss Australia meeting re lab testing with Adam G.	0.1	925.00	92.50
4/27/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email to establish meeting with Rod Mailer.	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/28/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re scheduling and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/29/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email to confirm meeting with Rod Mailer.	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/29/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Emails re call scheduling and next steps	0.1	775.00	77.50
4/30/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and provide revisions to complaint re EVOO designation at time of sale with Marie McCrary & Jeff Kaliel.	0.7	925.00	647.50
4/30/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Meeting with Rod Mailer re lab testing results; travel to and from meeting	10.0	950.00	9500.00
4/30/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Call re case strategy and related emails	0.6	775.00	465.00
5/1/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and email Adam G re meeting with Mailer; research same	0.3	925.00	277.50
5/1/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion with Seth Safier re details of meeting with Rod Mailer, Mailer as witness, test results, olive harvesting process, etc.	0.8	950.00	760.00
5/2/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Marie McCrary re details of expert witness, olive harvest process, lab testing.	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/2/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email discussion with Marie McCrary & Adam Gutride re lab testing.	0.1	925.00	92.50
5/5/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Seth re Complaint language on Plaintiff's purchase of Filippo Berio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/5/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and edit draft Complaint; discuss Filippo Berio purchase with Adam Gutride, K. Semplicio.		925.00	0.00
5/6/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Call with Safier to discuss Kumar purchase allegations with Seth Safier; Review and edit Salov and Safeway complaints	2.4	950.00	2280.00
5/6/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss Koller purchase allegations Kumar purchase allegations with Adam Gutride, Review and edit Class Action Complaint FB (v2); Class Action Complaint Safeway (v2).	4.0	925.00	3700.00
5/7/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss draft complaint with Seth Safier and Marie McCrary; Review research results on substantial relationship	1.3	950.00	1235.00
5/7/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss draft complaint with Adam Gutride & Marie McCraryd	0.5	925.00	462.50
5/8/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and revise draft Complaint; Discuss with Jeffrey Kaliel, Hassan Zavareei, Kristen Semplicio	1.8	950.00	1710.00
5/8/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review draft Complaint and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio re language re clear bottles	0.4	925.00	370.00
5/14/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and edit draft Complaint.	1.0	950.00	950.00
5/18/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time sheet for Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/22/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Class Action Complaint Kumar v FB (v3) and Discuss with Seth Safier and Kristen Semplicio.	0.5	950.00	475.00
5/22/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review Draft Complaint; and Discuss with Adam Gutride and Kristen Semplicio.	0.5	925.00	462.50
5/22/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Review email re A. Gutride discussion with expert	0.1	775.00	77.50
5/27/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Class Action Complaint Kumar v FB (FINAL); Class Action Complaint Kumar v Safeway (FINAL); Class Action Complaint Koller v Med Foods Inc (FINAL) and Discuss assigned Judges with Seth Safier.	1.0	950.00	950.00
5/27/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and finalize draft complaints in Safeway and Med Foods; file same; discuss pre filing with TZ	5.0	925.00	4625.00
5/29/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss related case filing in Florida with Seth Safier;	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/29/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss related case with Hassan Zavareei.	0.2	925.00	185.00
6/2/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss Florida atty with Hassan Zavareei	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/2/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review timesheet for Marie McCrary;	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/3/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Meeting with Seth Safier, Hassan Zavareei, Jeff Kaliel; Review research on Ebin v. Kangadis Food Inc.	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/3/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Meeting with Adam Gutride, Hassan Zavareei, Jeff Kaliel.	1.0	925.00	925.00
6/5/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Ebin v. Kangadis Food Inc. research and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei.	0.3	950.00	285.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
6/11/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conversation with opposing counsel & discussion with Hassan Zavareei re Safeway, Filippo Berio, and country of origin.	0.3	925.00	277.50
7/14/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email conversation with Adam Gutride, Marie McCrary re Sagra and ItalFoods; research same on Internet	1.0	925.00	925.00
7/21/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time sheet for Kristen Semplicio.	0.1	950.00	95.00
7/23/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	conference with Kristen Semplicio, Seth Safier, Hassan Zavareei re MedFoods, DeOleo, Salov Olive Oil Cases, Review & revise Issues Raised in Dispositive Motions	1.0	950.00	950.00
7/23/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email re re hearing date with Kristen Semplicio; Review & Discuss with Adam Gutride: MedFoods, DeOleo, Salov Olive Oil Cases - Issues Raised in Dispositive Motions.	1.0	925.00	925.00
7/24/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Schedule Koller v Med Foods - Rule 26(f) conf; Kumar v Safeway -draft and research Demurrer oppositon; review and draft Koller v MedFoods - CMC statement; prepare for hearing on MTD, Kumar v Salov	5.1	950.00	4845.00
7/24/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email discussion with Jeff Kaliel, Hassan Zavareei, Kristen Semplicio re timing to file Safeway, Salov, et al.	0.1	925.00	92.50
7/28/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Seth Safier re labeling & country of origin; email conversation with Kristen Semplicio re judicial notice for labels.	0.2	950.00	190.00
7/28/14	Marie McCrary	OliveOil	Review email re oppositions to demurrers and RFJn	0.2	750.00	150.00
7/28/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	Email team re oppositions	0.3	775.00	232.50
7/29/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Marie McCrary re including judicial notice of labels.	0.2	950.00	190.00
7/29/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio & Marie McCrary re judicial notice of the labels	0.2	925.00	185.00
7/30/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Marie McCrary & Kristen Semplicio re proposed protective orders; Review Protective Order Koller Deoleo; Protective Order P&G.	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/5/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Prepare for and conduct call with TZ re olive oil cases	0.5	950.00	475.00
8/6/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review, revise, and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio EVOO - Third Party subpoena master list (v1);	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/6/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss and revise with Kristen Semplicio EVOO - subpoena list	0.2	925.00	185.00
8/7/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and Discuss with Hassan Zavareei re Discovery and Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v Salov - review GSLLP inserts to Opp to MTD	2.1	950.00	1995.00
8/28/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss filing supplemental authority with Hassan Zavareei, Seth Safier; research local rules	1.1	950.00	1045.00
8/28/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and discussed Wallace v. ConAgra with Kristen Semplicio; discuss filing supp authority in federal cases	0.4	925.00	370.00
9/3/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Internal call on discovery issues	0.5	925.00	462.50
9/12/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email correspondence with Rod Mailer re olive oil sprays testing; Discuss payment of testing fees with Seth Safier.	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/15/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and meet and confer with Collin W (Sidley) re Ltr to Hon. Gonzalez Rogers re_ Discovery Stay (GSLLP 091514).DO; and Safeway - order on demurrer	1.0	925.00	925.00
10/16/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	attntion deposition dates for Safeway & Deoleo; email conversation with Marie McCrary re protective orders; discuss depositions with Plaintiffs	1.0	925.00	925.00
11/3/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time entry for Marie McCrary.	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/18/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss olive oil experts with Seth Safier; Kristen Semplicio; case call with Seth	1.2	950.00	1140.00
11/18/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss olive oil experts with Kristen Semplicio, Adam Gutride.	1.0	925.00	925.00
11/19/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and Discuss Class Action Complaint Kumar v Safeway (FINAL); FIRST AMENDED Class Action Complaint Koller v Med Foods Inc (Final) with Kristen Semplicio.	2.1	950.00	1995.00
11/19/14	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil	discuss experts with Seth S.; follow up	0.2	775.00	155.00
11/19/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss olive oil experts with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	925.00	185.00
11/20/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Call with Collin W.	0.2	950.00	190.00
11/23/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio re Kumar, Koller cases.	0.1	950.00	95.00
11/24/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review producer-initiated mislabeling olive oil lawsuit and Discuss olive oil expert with Kristen Semplicio.	0.6	950.00	570.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
12/1/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Semplicio re FOIA request for information considered by the CBP in its advisory letters on country of origin labeling, sales information on Safeway & Deoleo, and other related topic; research same	0.8	950.00	760.00
12/2/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Kristen Semplicio, Seth Safier re selecting olive oil experts.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/2/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email conversation with Adam Gutride re selecting olive oil experts; Discuss consistent pricing issue with Kristen Semplicio.	0.2	925.00	185.00
12/2/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Call with Brattle Group re experts	0.7	950.00	665.00
12/10/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Prep for and attend conference with Seth Safier, Kristen Semplicio, Jeffrey Kaliel, Andrew Silver re EVOO cases.	1.0	950.00	950.00
12/10/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Prepare for / conduct conference with Adam Gutride, Kristen Semplicio, Jeffrey Kaliel, Andrew Silver re EVOO cases.	1.0	925.00	925.00
12/11/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Prepare for / conduct conference with Seth Safier, Kristen Semplicio, Jeffrey Kaliel, Andrew Silver re postponed hearing.	1.0	950.00	950.00
12/11/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Prepare for / conduct conference with Adam Gutride, Kristen Semplicio, Jeffrey Kaliel, Andrew Silver re postponed hearing.	1.0	925.00	925.00
12/15/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Prepare for / conduct conference with TZ		950.00	0.00
12/15/14	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Prepare for / conduct conference with cocounsel re cases	0.3	925.00	277.50
12/17/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review email from TZLegal re Safeway EVOO matter.	0.3	950.00	285.00
12/21/14	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/5/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	MP draft CLRA letter; draft complaint	4.0	925.00	3700.00
1/6/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	finalize draft CLRA and complaint	5.6	925.00	5180.00
1/8/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review organization of case files.	0.5	925.00	462.50
1/13/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	prep for call and call with Colin Weir re cases - expert discussion with C Weir re obtaining pricing data via subpoena and negotiation; report to team re same	1.2	950.00	1140.00
1/13/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio re Kumar v. Safeway, Kumar v. Salov.	0.1	950.00	95.00
1/25/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Analyze and spot check time entry for Kristen Semplicio - Salov scheduling team meeting	0.1	925.00	92.50
2/4/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	prepare for and attend call with co-counsel EVOO cases.	0.8	950.00	760.00
2/9/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review defendants discovery responses in EVOO cases.	0.7	950.00	665.00
2/12/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Kumar v Safeway - Protective Order (entered) . Discuss accusing Sagra brand with Seth Safier; revise CMC statement with Kristen Semplicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
2/12/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss Sagra, ItalFoods allegations and facts with Adam Gutride.	0.5	925.00	462.50
2/12/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	email Hassan re staffing issues	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/12/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	conference with C Weir re expert analysis; IRI data	0.6	950.00	570.00
2/13/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conduct and prep for teleconference with Collin W. re Kumar v Safeway (Safeway brand) > Kumar v Salov (Filippo Berio brand; possibly also Sagra brand) > Koller v Med Foods, DeOleo (Bertolli and Carapelli brands).	0.7	950.00	665.00
2/13/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	teleconference with C Weir re damage analysis; IRI subpoenas	0.4	950.00	380.00
2/16/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Draft Deoleo Schedule A; Deoleo Subpoena; Salov Subpoena; Draft Safeway Schedule A; Draft Salov Schedule A with Kristen Semplicio.	1.5	950.00	1425.00
2/16/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	attention to third party retailer subpoenas	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email conversation with Seth Safier re nationwide class on IFI claim.	0.8	950.00	760.00
2/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	attention to new plaintiffs re olive oil sprays	0.1	950.00	95.00
2/19/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and Discuss with Kristen Semplicio: Report R14-00382 EVOO Test Results.	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/19/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Call with Adam Gutride re EVOO Test result report	0.5	925.00	462.50
2/19/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review comprehensive report on case status and discovery issues, address outstanding questions	0.9	950.00	855.00
2/22/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and Discuss with Seth Safier: EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet.	1.0	950.00	950.00
2/22/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	prepare and discusse with Adam Gutride: EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet.	0.8	925.00	740.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
2/24/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review ConAgra class cert decision; discuss with team; conference call with co-counsel re case status	1.4	950.00	1330.00
2/25/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	prepare for call and phone conference with TZ and Kristen Simpicio re expert reports, document management, attend CMC	3.8	950.00	3610.00
2/25/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	prepare for and conduct call with co-counsel and GSLLP attorneys	0.7	950.00	665.00
2/25/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	call with co-counsel	0.5	925.00	462.50
3/3/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	edit third party subpoena document requests	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/9/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss document review platforms for Epiq, other Discovery partners with Anna Haac; reserch use of Eipq	0.4	950.00	380.00
3/9/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	follow up on IRI nielsen subpoenas	0.1	950.00	95.00
3/13/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding document review with co-counsel; Preparing email to co-counsel regarding same.	0.1	850.00	85.00
3/16/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Telephone conference with Anna Haac regarding document review software and platforms; Attending demonstration of Xera document review program; Telephone conference with sales representative regarding Relativity document review software; Research regarding other document review software options, including Logikull; Preparing inquiry and email to Logikull representative.	4.5	850.00	3825.00
3/17/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Telephone conference with Todd Eastman of LogikCull regarding document review; Testing LogikCull; Preparing internal email regarding same; Fact research regarding predictive coding; Preparing internal email regarding predictive coding.	3.1	850.00	2635.00
3/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Global phone conference for EVOO; Email with Stephanie Stroup re Kumar deposition location.	1.0	950.00	950.00
3/23/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	con call with Kristen Simpicio, Adam Gutride re Salov	0.5	925.00	462.50
3/24/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Simpicio re E-discovery guidelines and model stipulation; preparing for call with TZLegal with Anna Haac, Kristen Simpicio; meet/confer call with opposing counsel	1.0	950.00	950.00
3/24/15	Kristen Simpicio	OliveOil	con call with Anna H and S. Safier	0.4	775.00	310.00
3/24/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	prepare for phone conference with TZLegal with Anna Haac, Kristen Simpicio.	0.6	925.00	555.00
3/24/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to Todd Eastman of LogikCull regarding document review software; Preparing spreadsheet of costs of document review software; Sending spreadsheet to Todd Eastman; Preparing emails to Brenden Ansier regarding Epiq document review software; Fact research regarding document review software; Telephone conference with Todd Eastman regarding LogikCull document review software; Preparing internal email regarding price of document review software; Testing LogikCull software; Inviting team members to LogikCull test; Preparing email to LogikCull regarding inability to load production.	3.6	850.00	3060.00
3/25/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	prepare for meet and confer with TZLegal with Kristen Simpicio; Discuss meeting to negotiate stipulations on metadata.	0.5	950.00	475.00
3/25/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding problems with LogikCull document review system; Corresponding with LogikCull support regarding same; Preparing email to Brendan Ansier regarding DocuMatrix document review software	0.5	850.00	425.00
3/26/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss proposing an ESI protocol stip with Anna Haac, Kristen Simpicio; phone conference with cocounsel re EVOO; further meet/confer with opposing counsel	1.0	950.00	950.00
3/26/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Attending demonstration of Epiq DocuMatrix document review software; Preparing internal emails regarding same; Preparing emails to LogikCull regarding document review software	1.2	850.00	1020.00
3/27/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to Todd Eastman regarding scheduling LogikCull demo for Marie and Kristen.	0.1	850.00	85.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
3/29/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to Todd Eastman regarding LogikCull demo.	0.1	850.00	85.00
3/30/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding LogikCull's ability to enable document review by co-counsel; Preparing internal email regarding LogikCull's ability to assign batches of documents to different reviewers.	0.2	850.00	170.00
3/31/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	call with co-counsel; prepare for same; follow up following call	1.0	950.00	950.00
3/31/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to Todd Eastman of LogikCull regarding document review software	0.1	850.00	85.00
4/1/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to Kristen regarding document review, printing, and tagging in LogikCull; Researching same.	0.5	850.00	425.00
4/6/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding LogikCull.	0.1	850.00	85.00
4/7/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing emails to Todd Eastman regarding joining LogikCull; Preparing email to Seth Safier regarding billing for LogikCull.	0.2	850.00	170.00
4/9/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Participating in LogikCull training call.	0.8	850.00	680.00
4/10/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review research from Kristen Simplicio re self-regulation of advertising.	0.5	950.00	475.00
4/12/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to Brendan Ansier regarding document review.	0.1	850.00	85.00
4/13/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss research with Kristen Simplicio re self-regulation of advertising.	0.5	950.00	475.00
4/13/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding using LogikCull for document review; Preparing email to LogikCull support staff regarding training; Attempting to upload documents to LogikCull; Preparing email to LogikCull support staff regarding uploading documents; Preparing internal email regarding uploading of Olive Oil production to LogikCull.	2.5	850.00	2125.00
4/13/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review article and discuss strategy re Advertising Self Regulatory Council	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/14/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	attention to IRI subpoenas, notice to defendants and email to attorney Becker	0.3	950.00	285.00
4/14/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to LogikCull support staff regarding training.	0.1	850.00	85.00
4/15/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review IRI subpoenas with Kristen Simplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/15/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review issues re Neilsen and IRI subpoenas	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/15/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding document review; Preparing internal emails regarding Deoleo production.	0.2	850.00	170.00
4/17/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding uploading document productions to LogikCull; Uploading document production to LogikCull.	1.8	850.00	1530.00
4/20/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	attention to assignment of tasks to cocounsel	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/20/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding LogikCull training and document production.	0.1	850.00	85.00
4/21/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Simplicio; Discuss Call with TZ re subpoenas.		925.00	0.00
4/21/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding reviewing Deoleo production on LogikCull.	0.2	850.00	170.00
4/23/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Attempting to upload document production; Preparing emails to LogikCull regarding document upload failures.	1.5	850.00	1275.00
4/24/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing emails to LogikCull regarding document upload.	0.1	850.00	85.00
4/27/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding upload of document productions to LogikCull; Uploading DEOLEO0047428 et seq. to LogikCull.	1.6	850.00	1360.00
4/29/15	Kristen Simplicio	OliveOil	Call re third party subpoenas	0.3	775.00	232.50
4/29/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss status of subpoenas with Kristen Simplicio, Seth Safier .	0.3	950.00	285.00
4/29/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss status of subpoenas with Adam G.	0.4	925.00	370.00
4/29/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	address settlement with Lettieri	0.2	950.00	190.00
4/30/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email re re status of subpoenas with Kristen Simplicio.	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/30/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	discuss price data subpoenas; internet research re same	0.9	950.00	855.00
5/4/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding uploading Salov document productions; Researching tagging methods in LogikCull.	0.3	850.00	255.00
5/4/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	edit document tagging protocol	0.8	950.00	760.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
5/5/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding Powerpoint rotation problem in LogikCull; Fact research regarding options for fixing rotation problem; Preparing emails to LogikCull support regarding rotation problem.	1.5	850.00	1275.00
5/7/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and edit IRI Subpoenas	0.3	950.00	285.00
5/7/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review correspondence with IRI re pricing information	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/8/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discussion and Email with Kristen Simplicio, Rod Mailer re labels for oil testing.	0.4	950.00	380.00
5/14/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Simplicio re Nielsen data.	0.1	925.00	92.50
5/14/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	discussions re IRI and Nielsen responses to subpoenas	0.3	950.00	285.00
5/15/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	discuss document review issues	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/15/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading Deoleo document production; Preparing internal email regarding same.	0.2	850.00	170.00
5/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Jeffrey Kaliei re expert in EVOO cases;	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/18/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re Olive Oil - IRI Subpoenas.	0.6	925.00	555.00
5/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss IRI subpoenas with Seth Safier	0.1	950.00	95.00
5/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	review possible data set options for IRI	0.2	950.00	190.00
5/19/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Jeff Kaliei, Rod Mailer, Kristen Simplicio re phone conference re opening expert declaration for class cert.	0.4	950.00	380.00
5/19/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Adjusting LogikCull admin settings.	0.2	850.00	170.00
5/20/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Phone conf re Olive Oil - IRI Subpoenas; call with Rod Mailer	2.2	950.00	2090.00
5/22/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and research EVOO testing standards	0.5	950.00	475.00
5/26/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Read and Discuss research with Anna Haac, et al. re NYT article about Italian olive oil; schedule and prepare for seminar on supply chain and EVOO with defense counsel and scientists; Email with EVOO team and Rod Mailer re chlorophyll in EVOO.	5.0	950.00	4750.00
5/26/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re Olive Oil - IRI Subpoenas.	0.2	925.00	185.00
5/26/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Configuring Olive Oil LogikCull project for Seth Safier; Preparing internal email to Kristen Simplicio regarding Deoleo production; Downloading Deoleo production; Editing production load files to ensure compatibility with LogikCull; Compressing production and uploading it to LogikCull.	1.4	850.00	1190.00
5/27/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Attended seminar on EVOO; email exchange with Kristen Simplicio re California geographic origin claims.	7.0	950.00	6650.00
5/28/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time entry - Kristen Simplicio, Seth Safier; Review Email re value of Italian Origin and Discuss with Matt McCrary.	0.7	950.00	665.00
5/28/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	review time sheet Simplicio; review geo origin email and research	0.3	925.00	277.50
5/29/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	draft research from EVOO seminar and Discuss with Kristen Simplicio, Seth Safier, Hassan Zavareei.	1.2	950.00	1140.00
5/29/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss with Kristen Simplicio setting up a call re witness designations.	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/1/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss with Kristen Simplicio: Regular and Extra Light Olive Oil, lampante designations; Review Combined Olive Oil Response for Gutride Saifer LLP - June 2015.	1.2	950.00	1140.00
6/2/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Simplicio re Combined Olive Oil Response for Gutride Saifer LLP - June 2015 and testing oils.	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/2/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	ReviewOlive oil response document	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/2/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading Deoleo document production; Modifying load files; Uploading document production to LogikCull.	1.0	850.00	850.00
6/3/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review 22757_EVOO_Presentation; Email with Jeff Kaliei re Olive Oil: Mailer Declaration.	0.5	950.00	475.00
6/5/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss IRI Data for olive oil with David Becker; prepare for same	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/5/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading Deoleo's Ninth supplemental document production; Modifying load files; Attempting to upload production to LogikCull; Preparing internal email regarding technical problem with document production.	1.6	850.00	1360.00
6/8/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review IRI data; review combined olive oil response document	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/8/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding removing document from LogikCull.	0.1	850.00	85.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
6/9/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding videographer for deposition in Spain; Searching elance.com for videographers in Spain.	0.4	850.00	340.00
6/10/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion with Kristen Smplicio re IRI data; Conference with Sally at National Consumers League; prepare for call	0.2	950.00	190.00
6/12/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	research and draft Rod Mailer declaration iso class cert	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/12/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email re Kristen Smplicio, Hassan Zavareei, Collin W. re Salov, Deoleo, & Safeway cases; phone conference with Anna Haac to discuss expert analysts.	5.1	925.00	4717.50
6/15/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Seth Safier re Rod Mailer declaration; Email with Rod Mailer re Safeway, Berio, Bertolli tests; Review Wagga CSU olive oil test report; conference call with C Weir; prepare for call with Colin W.	0.5	950.00	475.00
6/16/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	research and draft Rod Mailer declaration iso class cert	1.9	950.00	1805.00
6/16/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with expert witness Mary Flynn	7.0	925.00	6475.00
6/17/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review with team: 2012.09.05 Memo re New EVOO Bottle Purchases; email conferenece with Hassan Zavareei, Jeffrey Kaliel reBertolli, Deoleo labels.	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with expert witness re National Consumers' League test results; Review Final Protective Order (Salov) (final); Deoleo Protective Order (FINAL); Kumar v Safeway - Protective Order (entered) with Kristen Smplicio.	0.2	950.00	190.00
6/19/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re Olive oil cases - protective order.	0.4	950.00	380.00
6/21/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Smplicio.	0.1	950.00	95.00
6/21/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	schedule phone conference with Rod Mailer; Review Weir Signed Salov-Deoleo from Collin W..	0.1	925.00	92.50
6/22/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	draft Mailer Retainer Agreement;Discuss sae with Hassan Zavareei; Review Kumar v Safeway - Protective Order (entered); Deoleo Protective Order (FINAL); Final Protective Order (Salov) (final) and Discuss with Rod Mailer.	0.4	950.00	380.00
6/23/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review EVOO -- DRAFT Mailer Retainer Agreement and Discuss olive oil testing with Adam Gutride.	1.8	950.00	1710.00
6/23/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email Kristen Smplicio re Potential co-counsel opportunity; Email re re Rod Mailer re terms of agreement and professional background; Review RJM Publications Adam Gutride 2015.	0.3	925.00	277.50
6/24/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	prepare phone conference on RFAs, form rogs, special rogs with Kristen Smplicio; correspondence with Mark Koba re Fortune article on Kumar case.	2.0	950.00	1900.00
6/24/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Reviewing Fortune article regarding olive oil; Adding article to website; Preparing internal emails regarding same.	1.9	925.00	1757.50
6/24/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Review Lit Review.zip from Collin W.; revise & Discuss Kumar v Safeway - Mtn for Class Cert (v13) with Kristen Smplicio; Review IOC EU Olive Production; IOC World Olive Production with Matt McCrary; Review and dDiscuss with Rod Mailer Report R14-00382; R15-00089; EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet; EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet; call with co-counsel	0.3	850.00	255.00
6/25/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	phone conference with Rod Mailer re oil testing; prepare for same	0.6	950.00	570.00
6/26/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Assisting with document production problem.	1.0	950.00	950.00
6/26/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Review invoice from Rod Mailer;	0.6	850.00	510.00
6/29/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and processed invoice from Rod Mailer.	0.2	950.00	190.00
6/29/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email correspondence re invoice from Rod Mailer.	0.2	925.00	185.00
6/30/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Finalized payment for Rod Mailer, corresponded with Rod Mailer.	0.1	925.00	92.50
7/1/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding uploading documents to LogikCull; Downloading Deoleo production; Revising load files; Uploading production to LogikCull.	0.2	925.00	185.00
7/7/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Troubleshooting problem with upload of documents to LogikCull; Preparing internal emails regarding same; Preparing emails to LogikCull support regarding same.	1.2	850.00	1020.00
7/8/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil		3.4	850.00	2890.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
7/9/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to LogikCull regarding processing .rar files; Checking on status of document processing; Preparing internal email regarding same; Troubleshooting problem uploading documents to LogikCull; Preparing emails to LogikCull support regarding same.	3.5	850.00	2975.00
7/10/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Phone conference with Kristen re Potential co-counsel opportunity; research potential co-counsel	0.5	950.00	475.00
7/10/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Recompressing document production and sending to LogikCull for troubleshooting; Preparing internal email regarding same; Telephone call with Kristen Smplicio regarding same.	1.0	850.00	850.00
7/13/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding emailing of production documents; Downloading production and uploading to LogikCull; Preparing internal emails regarding redaction of documents while preserving metadata; Telephone call with Kristin Smplicio regarding same.	1.9	850.00	1615.00
7/14/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Researching options for redacting documents; Preparing internal email regarding Adobe Professional; Preparing internal email regarding adding additional Olive Oil matter to LogikCull.	0.5	850.00	425.00
7/15/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smpilcio, Rob Gain re Kumar v Safeway - Redacted class cert filings.zip; Review and Discuss 2012.10.26 Final Lab Report for All Ash Tested Oils; 2012.10.03 All Final Lab Results for Bottles Sent to Australia; 2012.10.03 Olive Oil Sample Submission Form Signed by Ash with Kristen Smplicio.	3.0	950.00	2850.00
7/16/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Sean Commons, Kristen Smplicio re Kumar v. SNA: meet and confer; Review and Discuss with Kristen Smplicio: 2012.10.03 Olive Oil Sample Submission Form Signed by Ash; 2012.11.15 Invoices for Ash Bottles Tested at Australian Lab; draft, Discuss, and finalized EVOO -- FINAL Mailer Retainer Agreement with KRisten Smplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
7/16/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smplicio re Olive oil - final call for documents and 2012.10.03 Olive Oil Sample Submission Form Signed by Ash; 2012.11.15 Invoices for Ash Bottles Tested at Australian Lab	0.4	925.00	370.00
7/17/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re Myristic Acid; phone conference with team re olive oil testing; research same	1.5	950.00	1425.00
7/20/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	conference call with co counsel; prep for same	1.0	950.00	950.00
7/21/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss remaining review in Deoleo, Salov with Kristen Smplicio.	0.4	950.00	380.00
7/22/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal email regarding Salov production.	0.1	850.00	85.00
7/23/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss Ash report with Kristen Smplicio.	0.3	950.00	285.00
7/23/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading Deoleo production; Modifying load files; Troubleshooting problem uploading production to LogikCull; Preparing email to LogikCull regarding problem; Uploading production.	0.8	850.00	680.00
7/24/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Discuss scheduling meet and confer with Rob Gain; prepare for same	0.5	950.00	475.00
7/26/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride, Kristen Smplicio re EVOO receipts; collect and review receipts; review document production	1.0	925.00	925.00
7/27/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Phone conference with Rob Gain re EVOO litigation; Discuss scheduling deposition with Rod Mailer;	0.5	950.00	475.00
7/27/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smplicio re EVOO receipts.	0.1	925.00	92.50
7/27/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	purchase new EVOO	4.0	925.00	3700.00
7/28/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Mike Dennis re Olive oil surveys; research and review Dennis expert reports	1.3	950.00	1235.00
7/28/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	draft THIRD EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet v1 spreadsheet and Discuss with Adam Gutride; purchase new EVOO	7.0	925.00	6475.00
7/29/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smplicio re Olive Oil Bottles in TZ Storage spreadsheet; discuss Weir data with Seth S.	0.1	950.00	95.00
7/29/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re Colin Weir analysis & data.	0.7	925.00	647.50
7/30/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re depositpn dates; call with cocounsel; prepare for same	0.8	950.00	760.00
7/30/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	strategy call with cocounsel	0.5	925.00	462.50

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
7/31/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	procure, catalog and review EVOO samples	5.0	925.00	4625.00
8/3/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Marie McCrary.	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/4/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/5/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading and extracting Salov productions; Modifying load files; Configuring Salov project on LogikCull; Uploading productions to LogikCull; Troubleshooting and fixing issue with load files.	3.5	850.00	2975.00
8/10/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing email to LogikCull representative regarding document storage.	0.1	850.00	85.00
8/11/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Telephone conference with LogikCull regarding document storage.	0.3	850.00	255.00
8/14/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email re re Olive Oil Label gathering project with Kristen Semplicio, Marie McCrary.	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/17/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Uploading files to LogikCull; Preparing internal email regarding same; Preparing email to LogikCull regarding same.	1.2	850.00	1020.00
8/18/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re olive oil testing.	0.2	950.00	190.00
8/19/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	internal team strategy call re olive oil cases	0.5	950.00	475.00
8/19/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	internal team strategy call re olive oil cases; meeting with Adam Gutride re cases, including settlement	1.0	925.00	925.00
8/20/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Prepare for and conduct call with Collin W. (Sidley)	0.4	950.00	380.00
8/21/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Emily Shurr re Olive Oil label research results; call with S Safier re testing results and lab science	1.1	950.00	1045.00
8/21/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re wax & sterol testing; discuss same real time	0.8	925.00	740.00
8/24/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	call with Rob Gain re Canada cases	0.5	950.00	475.00
8/25/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Emily Shurr re Olive Oil label research results;	0.1	950.00	95.00
8/26/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Semplicio re olive oil label gathering project.	0.1	950.00	95.00
8/31/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email re oil testing results with Rod Mailer.	0.1	950.00	95.00
8/31/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email re re oil testing results with Adam Gutride.	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/2/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email Rod Mailer re testin; review same	0.3	950.00	285.00
9/13/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio; Review responses to RFAs and Rogs	0.2	925.00	185.00
9/14/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review R15-01280-F-V1; R15-01280 R15-01280 Organoleptic Results spreadsheet; R15-01280 2 New Classification Requirements by IOC and Discuss with Rod Mailer.	1.0	950.00	950.00
9/14/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discuss Olive oil label chart with Kristen Semplicio.	0.3	925.00	277.50
9/16/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading document productions and uploading them to LogikCull; Preparing internal email regarding same.	1.1	850.00	935.00
9/19/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Single Reports for 3A-3S US Oils from Rod Mailer.	0.5	950.00	475.00
9/21/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re Rod Mailer testing of EVOO	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/22/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and Discuss with team: olive oil testing results; Review IRI Olive Oil Sales by Year KGS notes spreadsheet with Kristen Semplicio.	1.0	950.00	950.00
9/30/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	call with Rob Gain re Canada cases; prepare for call	0.6	950.00	570.00
9/30/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding productions uploaded to LogikCull.	0.4	850.00	340.00
10/2/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review and revise 2012.09.05 Memo re New EVOO Bottle Purchases.	0.5	950.00	475.00
10/3/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re olive oil tests.	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/5/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re payment of Rod Mailer Invoice for analysis of olive oils	0.2	925.00	185.00
10/5/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	address payment to Rod Mailer for testing reports	0.1	950.00	95.00
10/6/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re California Olive Ranch.	0.1	925.00	92.50
10/6/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	California olive ranch discuss with S. Safier	0.1	950.00	95.00
10/6/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Uploading document production to LogikCull; Preparing email to co-counsel regarding reviewing documents on LogikCull.	0.9	850.00	765.00
10/15/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading production; Preparing file for upload; Uploading to LogikCull.	1.1	850.00	935.00
10/27/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Downloading document production; Preparing production for upload to LogikCull; Uploading production to LogikCull; Preparing internal emails and emails to co-counsel regarding same.	2.4	850.00	2040.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
10/28/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	call with Rob Gain re Canada cases	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/28/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing emails to co-counsel regarding document production.	0.1	850.00	85.00
10/29/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review and Email with Adam Gutrdie re next steps and GutrideSafier-Estimate	0.3	925.00	277.50
11/4/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smplicio re Producing olive oil competitors' labels.	0.1	925.00	92.50
11/23/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smplicio re Deoleo and Salov stay motions.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/8/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re deposition and invoice.	0.2	950.00	190.00
12/8/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Adam Gutride re Mailer deoposition.	0.1	925.00	92.50
12/10/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Conference with Seth Safier re Canadian attorneys - EVOO.	1.0	950.00	950.00
12/10/15	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Conference with Adam Gutride re EVOO suit in Canada	1.0	925.00	925.00
12/10/15	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing internal emails regarding telephone conference about document productions.	0.1	850.00	85.00
12/11/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review article re olive oil cases; answer calls from putative class members	0.6	950.00	570.00
12/16/15	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re deposition planning.	0.2	950.00	190.00
1/4/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email discussion with Adam Gutride re 60 minutes did a story on counterfeit Italian foods; view 60 minutes story re Ital food	0.3	925.00	277.50
1/25/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re details of report, re Report R14-00382; R15-00089; EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet; EVOO Purchase Test Spreadsheet spreadsheet; R14-00382; review same	1.3	950.00	1235.00
1/25/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Matt McCrary re Colin W. transcript.	0.4	925.00	370.00
1/26/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Collin W. re Notice of Subpoena of Weir; Email re re and Review 2012.10.26 R. Mailer Rebuttal Expert Report with Kristen Smplicio.	0.6	950.00	570.00
1/26/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Depo prep - Mailer; travel	6.5	925.00	6012.50
1/27/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Kristen Smplicio re packaging guidelines; email conversation with Seth Safier re retail standards.	0.3	950.00	285.00
1/27/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Discussions re retail standards; review standards online	0.5	925.00	462.50
2/23/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Confer with Matt McCrary e. Re: C. Weir outstanding invoice; Review time entry for Kristen Smp,licio.	0.2	925.00	185.00
2/24/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Proposed Order Granting Plf's Motion to Seal; 2016.02.24 Proposed Letter of Request with Kristen Smplicio.	0.5	950.00	475.00
2/27/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Correspondence with Lesley Linton repayment of accounts and expenses	0.2	950.00	190.00
3/4/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Smplicio.	0.1	925.00	92.50
4/5/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Matt McCrary.	0.1	925.00	92.50
4/10/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Kristen Smplicio time entry	0.1	950.00	95.00
4/11/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review Kristen Smplicio time entry	0.1	925.00	92.50
4/18/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email converence with Adam Gutride re EVOO	0.2	925.00	185.00
4/28/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Meeting with Rod Mailer	3.0	950.00	2850.00
4/28/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Meeting and travel; Mailer in SF	3.5	925.00	3237.50
5/4/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Matt McCrary.	0.1	925.00	92.50
8/4/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Email with Todd Kennedy, Marie McCrary re Deoleo, Salov, Safeway file storage	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/2/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review Kristen Smplicio time entry	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/9/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email re and phone conference with UCLA School of Law re Consultation re White Paper on Food Fraud.	0.5	950.00	475.00
9/27/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Smplicio re Kumar v. Safeway, Kumar v. Salov.	0.1	925.00	92.50
9/30/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review research with Kristen Smplicio: Dole's 'All Natural' Labeling Is Misleading.	0.5	925.00	462.50
10/4/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email dicussion with Kristen Smplicio re premium is equivalent to the defendant's excess profit.	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/13/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email discussion with Kristen Smplicio re appointed class counsel.	0.2	950.00	190.00
10/19/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Review Effective Use of Litigation; and Discuss white paper with Michael Richards from UCLA.	1.0	950.00	950.00
10/20/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email re UCLA litigation guide	0.1	950.00	95.00

Exhibit 2: GSLLP Olive Oil Hours

DATE	PERSON	CASE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
10/21/16	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with team re Effective Use of Litigation;	0.1	950.00	95.00
10/21/16	Seth Safier	OliveOil	reviewi email re UCLA prof from AJG	0.1	925.00	92.50
1/9/17	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio.	0.1	925.00	92.50
1/26/17	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil	Preparing timekeeping reports.	0.3	850.00	255.00
1/28/17	Adam Gutride	OliveOil	Email with Rod Mailer re Re: update on olive oil	0.3	950.00	285.00
2/24/17	Seth Safier	OliveOil	Review time entry for Kristen Semplicio	0.1	925.00	92.50
TOTAL	Adam Gutride	OliveOil		158.6	950.00	150670.00
TOTAL	Seth Safier	OliveOil		136.8	925.00	126540.00
TOTAL	Todd Kennedy	OliveOil		55.7	850.00	47345.00
TOTAL	Kristen Semplicio	OliveOil		17.3	775.00	13407.50
TOTAL	Marie McCrary	OliveOil		0.2	750.00	150.00
TOTAL	Matt McCrary	OliveOil		0.0	725.00	0.00
			TOTAL	368.6		338112.50

EXHIBIT 3

Exhibit 3: GSLLP Costs

		<u>Kumar v. Salov</u>		
Expense				
Arbitrators/Mediators (E121)	8,500.00			
		10/11/16	Randal Wulff	8,500.00
Court Fees (E112)	400.00			
		5/23/14	US DC	400
Delivery Svcs & Msgrs (E107)	3,013.50			
		06/05/2014	S&R Services	55.00
		06/10/2014	S&R Services	55.00
		08/14/2014	S&R Services	85.00
		09/05/2014	Janney and Janney	36.50
		10/01/2014	S&R Services	65.00
		10/01/2014	S&R Services	65.00
		10/15/2014	S&R Services	65.00
		10/29/2014	A and A Legal Service	2,080.00
		05/01/2015	A and A Legal Service	230.50
		12/14/2015	S&R Services	65.00
		06/06/2016	S&R Services	85.00
		01/04/2017	S&R Services	126.50
				3,013.50
Deposition Transcripts (E115)	4,269.05			
		11/19/2014	Diane Skillman	92.15
		03/07/2016	DTI	356.00
		05/26/2016	Nogara Reporting Service	1,513.05
		06/09/2016	Masterphil's Media	350.00
		09/01/2016	DTI	1,957.85
				4,269.05
Experts (E119)	39,396.30			
		05/01/2014	Australian Oils Research	801.09
		11/07/2015	Economics and Technology Inc.	8,833.34
		03/01/2016	Economics and Technology Inc.	4,050.00
		05/12/2016	Economics and Technology Inc.	8,831.25
		07/01/2016	Economics and Technology Inc.	8,574.38
		03/10/2017	Economics and Technology Inc.	2,456.24
		04/05/2017	Economics and Technology Inc.	600.00
		Bill Pending	Economics and Technology Inc.	5,250.00
				39,396.30
Litigation Sup Vendors (E118)	8,098.34			
		07/01/2015	Logik Systems	498.34
		07/08/2015	Logik Systems	373.75
		09/29/2015	Logik Systems	373.75
		10/21/2015	Logik Systems	373.75
		01/06/2016	Logik Systems	1,121.25
		03/23/2016	Logik Systems	747.50
		04/26/2016	Logik Systems	373.75
		05/26/2016	Logik Systems	373.75
		07/19/2016	Logik Systems	373.75
		08/18/2016	Logik Systems	373.75
		10/27/2016	Logik Systems	872.50
		11/17/2016	Logik Systems	373.75
		12/15/2016	Logik Systems	373.75
		02/13/2017	Logik Systems	373.75
		02/21/2017	Logik Systems	747.50
		03/16/2017	Logik Systems	373.75
				8,098.34
Local Travel (E109)	81.40			
		09/05/2014	Sutter Stockton Garage	6.00
		09/30/2014	Oakland Parking Meter	4.00
		09/30/2014	Clay Street Garage	5.00
		10/14/2014	Sutter Stockton Garage	13.50
		12/30/2014	Seth 2014 mileage	28.00
		12/30/2014	Seth 2014 bridge toll	6.00
		12/30/2014	Adam 2014 mileage	5.60
		01/05/2016	Oakland Parking Meter	2.50
		12/31/2016	Adam 2016 mileage	10.80

Exhibit 3: GSLLP Costs

				81.40
Meals (E111)	221.40			
		04/30/2014	Fourteen	25.77
		10/14/2014	Tadich Grill	47.50
		10/23/2015	Starbucks	5.90
		10/24/2015	Cafe Yesterday	2.75
		10/24/2015	Cafe Yesterday	5.75
		10/30/2015	Peets Coffee/Tea	4.75
		12/30/2015	Adam 2015	18.10
		04/18/2016	Lockharts Smokehouse	17.73
		04/18/2016	Lockharts Smokehouse	6.50
		04/18/2016	Lockharts Smokehouse	10.50
		04/19/2016	Murphys Deli	21.73
		04/19/2016	Cantina Laredo	21.28
		04/20/2016	The Fairmont Hotel	17.07
		04/29/2016	Cash Receipt	16.07
				221.40
Online Research (E106)	191.64			
		08/05/2014	Pacer Service Center	83.28
		01/16/2015	Pacer Service Center	7.90
		02/04/2015	Pacer Service Center	21.90
		01/20/2016	Pacer Service Center	3.00
		02/05/2016	Pacer Service Center	23.33
		03/01/2016	Pacer Service Center	15.33
		07/21/2016	Pacer Service Center	36.80
		12/15/2016	Pacer Service Center	0.10
				191.64
Other (E124)	86.18			
		01/27/2014	Target	8.87
		09/11/2014	Amazon Services - Kindle	3.33
		07/25/2015	Ralph's	21.18
		07/31/2015	Safeway	26.21
		12/31/2016	Seth, 2016, product	26.59
				86.18
Out-of-Town Travel (E110)	1,162.58			
		04/02/2014	Uber - Australia	13.09
		04/03/2014	Airbnb - meeting Rob Mailer	443.34
		04/03/2014	Visa Services - meeting Mailer	6.17
		04/25/2014	Adina Apartment Sydney	84.17
		04/28/2014	Katoomba C/Rail	5.32
		03/23/2016	Southwest Airlines	165.96
		03/24/2016	Hotels.com	356.15
		04/18/2016	Uber	21.64
		04/19/2016	Uber	12.31
		04/19/2016	Uber	7.05
		04/19/2016	Uber	11.64
		04/19/2016	Uber	6.85
		04/19/2016	SWA Inflight Wifi	8.00
		04/20/2016	Uber	20.89
				1,162.58
Outside Printing (E102)	261.60			
		01/25/2016	Colour Drop	227.85
		04/19/2016	Hotel Business Centers	27.50
		04/19/2016	Hotel Business Centers	6.25
				261.60
Postage (E108)	220.07			
		05/27/2014	USPS	5.18
		05/29/2014	USPS	13.61
		08/11/2015	Fedex Kinkos	198.83
		07/06/2016	USPS	2.45
				220.07
xx	0.00			
Total Expense	65,902.06			